
No. Name of Project
Approved Budget for 

Contract
Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration

1
Construction of Look Out Tower, Ilagan-Divilacan Refo. Area 

1 - DBP Loan
249,999.99

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 10/25/2021 14 Calendar Days

2
Construction of Look Out Tower, Ilagan-Divilacan Refo. Area 

2 - DBP Loan
249,999.99

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 10/25/2021 14 Calendar Days

3
Construction of Look Out Tower, Ilagan-Divilacan Refo. Area 

3 - DBP Loan
249,999.99

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 10/25/2021 14 Calendar Days

4
Construction of Look Out Tower, Ilagan-Divilacan Refo. Area 

4 - DBP Loan
249,999.99

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 10/25/2021 14 Calendar Days

5
Construction of 10 Units Shelter for Displaced Families - 

LGSF - DRRAP
10,600,000.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

10,594,345.32 11/9/2021 390 Calendar Days

6
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along 

Carappigan Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.95 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,330.75 12/6/2021 68 Calendar Days

7
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Ueg Creek - 

Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.95 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,588.45 12/6/2021 90 Calendar Days

8
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Paddad 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.58 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,520.47 12/6/2021 81 Calendar Days

9
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Ubbog 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.63 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,257.70 12/6/2021 92 Calendar Days

10
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Sinalugan 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.98 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,405.84 12/6/2021 82 Calendar Days

11
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Gaddanan 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.57 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,427.30 12/6/2021 93 Calendar Days

Gamu, Isabela

San Mariano, Isabela

Alicia, Isabela

Cabatuan, Isabela

Angadanan, Isabela

San Mateo, Isabela

Sitio Cama, Simanu Norte, San 

Pablo, Isabela
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12

Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Cabuan-

Dalayap-Masigun Creek - 

Re-Programming 2021

4,999,999.28 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,099.51 12/6/2021 68 Calendar Days

13
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Patawig 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
5,000,000.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,303.12 12/6/2021 93 Calendar Days

14
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Casili 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.92 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,475.32 12/6/2021 66 Calendar Days

15
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Mallacopa 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.21 R.S.K.M. Construction Services

Mr. Richard Stephensun L. Almiron

Purok 1, Brgy. Camaal, Quirino, 

Isabela

4,949,305.82 12/6/2021 80 Clendar Days

16
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Marabulig 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.49 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,914.50 12/6/2021 85 Calendar Days

17
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Colorado 

Creek - Re-Programming 2021
4,999,999.55 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,933.87 12/6/2021 89 Calendar Days

18
Replacement of Broken Tiles at the Hallway and Lobby of 

manuel A. Roxas District Hospital - 

Re-Programming 2021

2,600,000.00 Nikel Construction & Trading
Mr. Narciso A. Eder, Jr.

San Fermin, Cauayan City, Isabela
2,588,209.03 12/6/2021 50 Calendar Days

19
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - 

Re-Programming 2021
2,263,263.19 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

2,259,664.33 12/6/2021 120 Calendar Days

20
Construction of 1 - Barrel 2.50m x 2.75m Reinforced 

Concrete Box Culvert - 

Re-Programming 2021

2,425,886.28 A. F. Manuel Construction Inc.
Ms. Aurea F. Manuel

#58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02

San Mateo, Isabela

2,423,743.70 12/6/2021 42 Calendar Days

21
Construction of halfway House Conference Hall with Office - 

Re-Programming 2021
2,500,000.00 SMT Construction

Mr. Samuel M. Toribio

Apitong St., Purok No. 1

Ilagan City, Isabela

2,492,173.10 12/6/2021 108 Calendar Days

22
Construction of halfway House Kitchen- Re-Programming 

2021
249,999.66 SMT Construction

Mr. Samuel M. Toribio

Apitong St., Purok No. 1

Ilagan City, Isabela

248,998.38 12/6/2021 20 Calendar Days

23
Reblocking of Ballacayu Farm to Market Road 

- Re-Programming 2021
3,999,999.99 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

3,993,743.11 12/6/2021 66 Calendar Days

24
Rehabilitation of Provincial Veterinary Office 

- Capital Outlay
1,500,000.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

1,496,526.21 12/6/2021 123 Calendar Days

Roxas, Isabela

Sitio Cama, Simanu Norte, San 

Pablo, Isabela

Namnama, Jones, Isabela

Capitol Compound, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

Capitol Compound, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

San Pablo, Isabela

Capitol Compound, Alibagu, 

City of Ilagan, Isabela

San Guillermo, Isabela

Burgos, Isabela

Roxas, Isabela

Mallig, Isabela

Aurora, Isabela

Cauayan City, Isabela
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25

Reconstruction of Damaged Concrete Shoulder and Slope 

Protection Along Ilagan-Divilacan Road (Km 8+945 - 8+985 

and km 10+860 - km 10+900) - LGSF-DRRAP

9,999,983.02 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

9,993,868.07 12/6/2021 157 Calendar Days

26

Reconstruction of Damaged RCBC and Rubble Masonry 

along Ilagan-Divilacan Road (Km 47+734, km 48+736 and 

Km 49+369) 

- LGSF-DRRAP

4,999,864.41 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

4,994,667.94 12/6/2021 53 Calendar Days

27
Reconstruction of Damaged Riverbank Protection of Simanu 

Sur Farm to Market Road 

- LGSF-DRRAP

10,000,000.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

9,993,778.39 12/6/2021 185 Calendar Days

ENGR. VIRGILIO S. LORENZO   BAC Member

(SGD.) MR. RODRIGO  T. SAWIT (SGD.) ATTY. JOHN RYAN P. TORIO
BAC  Chairman BAC Vice Chairman

BAC Member    BAC Member     BAC Member
(SGD.) MS. ELSA M. PASTRANA (SGD.) ENGR. VIRGILIO S. LORENZO (SGD.) MS. LUCILA M. AMBATALI

City of Ilagan, Isabela

City of Ilagan, Isabela

San Pablo, Isabela

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.


