Republic of the Philippines
CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT
PROVINCE OF ISABELA

ﬂ Quarter, CY _2021

Approved Budget for

No. Name of Project P Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration
. S . Ms. Grace M. Rodriguez
1 Const.ructlon of Hemodialysis Cent_er at Echague District 15,000,000.00 Echague, Isabela Camberwell Construction & Supplies Brgy. Magsaysay, Maharlika 14,987,803.20 7/26/2021 361 Calendar Days
Hospital - Trust Fund/Tobacco Excise Tax i o
Highway, Naguilian, Isabela
Construction of Hemodialysis Center at Milagros Albano ' Mr. Alfred Philip T. Vinarao
2 15,000,000.00 Cabagan, Isabela GAPTV Construction & Suppl ) 14,989,932.47 7/26/2021 361 Calendar D
District Hospital - Trust Fund/Tobacco Excise Tax & PPl Catabayungan, Cabagan, isabela /26/ alendar Days
Mr. Samuel M. Toribio
Construction of Hemodialysis Center at Manuel A. Roxas
3 [onstruction avs! an X 15,000,000.00 Roxas, Isabela SMT Construction Apitong St., Purok No. 1 14,990,001.68 7/26/2021 | 361 Calendar Days
District Hospital - Trust Fund/Tobacco Excise Tax .
llagan City, Isabela
Construction of Hemodialysis Center at Cauayan District . Dr. Mario Dela Fuente
4 ' 4 : v 15,000,000.00 Cauayan City, Isabela | MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp. 14,994,195.47 7/26/2021 361 Calendar Days
Hospital - Trust Fund/Tobacco Excise Tax Cabatuan, Isabela
Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
5 Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Bldg. - EDF 2021 3,699,999.96 Brgy. Rizaluna, Alicia, Isabela [A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 3,693,008.21 7/26/2021 132 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
i i . - EDF 2021 Brgy. San Antonio, Cauayan X i
g |Concreting of San Antonio Brgy. Road 0 999,999.93 gy->an ¥a" | MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp. Dr. Mario Dela Fuente 997,672.97 7/26/2021 30 Calendar Days
City, Isabela Cabatuan, Isabela
Rehabilitation of Potable Water System - . Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
Brgy. Villa Bello, Jones, .
7 EDF 2021 4,396,573.65 Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 4,391,866.74 7/26/2021 77 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
. A . Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
g |Repair/Rehabilitation & Relocation of Genset House at 1,367,021.83 Echague, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 1,365,990.39 7/26/2021 58 Calendar Days
Echague District Hospital - General Fund
San Mateo, Isabela
Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
Maintenance of Completed Union-Camasi FMR .
9 ED'F o P : : 249,999.84 Cabagan, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 249,485.35 8/24/2021 24 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
Maintenance of Completed Olango-Siempre Viva-Trinidad- Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
10 |Manano FMR - EDF 2021 499,999.70 Mallig, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 498,893.67 8/24/2021 39 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
Maintenance of Completed District Ill-Sta. Cruz FMR - EDF Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
11 2021 349,999.93 San Manuel, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 348,902.82 8/24/2021 33 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
Maintenance of Completed San Placido-Sinamar FMR - EDF Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
12 2021 449,999.78 Roxas, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 449,078.80 8/24/2021 34 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
. . . Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
13 [Maintenance of Completed Virgoneza-San Antonio-Sto. 499,999.69 San Agustin, Isabela  |A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 498,891.65 8/24/2021 | 27 Calendar Days

Nifio-Dabubu FMR - EDF 2021

San Mateo, Isabela




Approved Budget for

No. Name of Project T Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration
Maintenance & Improvement of Completed Diversion Dam Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
14 EDF 2021 P P 3,999,999.59 Capirpiriwan, Cordon, Isabela [A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 3,998,393.74 8/24/2021 76 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
. Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
15 |Maintenance & improvement of Completed Small Water 99,999.57 Namnama, Tumauini, Isabela |A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St Brgy. 02 99,485.37 8/24/2021 | 20 Calendar Days
Impounding Project (SWIP)- EDF 2021
San Mateo, Isabela
Maintenance & Improvement of Canal-Access Road of First Failed Biddi
ir 1 I n;
16 |Completed Small Water Impounding Project (SWIP) - EDF 1,499,999.04 Santos, Quezon, Isabela (N: biz seubmittedg) N/A N/A 8/24/2021 59 Calendar Days
2021
Maintenance & Improvement of Canal & Access Road of Sto. Domingo, Quirino Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
17 |Completed Small Water Impounding Project (SWIP) - EDF 3,999,999.59 ’ Isabel’a ! A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 3,993,239.75 8/24/2021 76 Calendar Days
2021 San Mateo, Isabela
Maintenance & Improvement of Completed Small Water . L First Failed Bidding
18 99,999.57 Aguinaldo, Naguilian, Isabela . )
Impounding Project (SWIP)- EDF 2021 & & (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 8/24/2021 20 Calendar Days
Maintenance & Improvement of Completed Small Water . o First Failed Bidding
19 99,999.57 Manaring, Naguilian, Isabela ) . N/A N/A 8/24/2021 20 Calendar D
Impounding Project (SWIP)- EDF 2021 6. Nag (No bid submitted) / / /24/ alendar Days
Maintenance & Improvement of Completed Small Water First Failed Bidding
20 199,999.14 San Jose, Jones, Isabela ) ) N/A N/A 8/24/2021 25 Calendar D
Impounding Project (SWIP)- EDF 2021 (No bid submitted) / / /24/ alendar Days
Maintenance & Improvement of Access Road of to the Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
21 |Completed Small Water Impounding Project (SWIP) - EDF 99,999.57 Kabigaan, Roxas, Isabela  |A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 99,377.32 8/24/2021 20 Calendar Days
2021 San Mateo, Isabela
Construction of 5 Units Shelter for Displaced Families - Trust Sitio Cama, Simanu Norte, San First Failed Bidding
22 10,600,000.00 ) )
Fund Pablo, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 9/27/2021 675 Calendar Days
Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
. . . Brgy. Ballacayu, San Pablo, . ) .
23 |Reconstruction of Damaged Dairy Milk Plant - Trust Fund 4,399,999.99 lsabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,394,358.01 9/27/2021 90 Calendar Days
City of Ilagan, Isabela
. . . . - Ms. Grace M. Rodriguez
Repair of Isabela Multi-Purpose Evacuation Center and Capitol Compound, City of . . .
24 |eP3! ulti-rurpose tvacuati 5,291,127.52 P P YO | camberwell Construction & Supplies Brgy. Magsaysay, Maharlika 5,276,014.02 9/27/2021 176 Calendar Days
Birthing Center - Trust Fund llagan, isabela . o
Highway, Naguilian, Isabela
25 |Reconstruction of Damaged Concrete Pavement and Slope 4,999,999.89 Echague, Isabela MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp. Dr. Mario Dela Fuente 4,995,502.71 9/27/2021 123 Calendar Days
Protection along Pag-asa - Narra Road - Trust Fund Cabatuan, Isabela
Mr. Richard Stephensun L. Almiron
26 |Concreting of Pisang Barangay Road, Phase 1 - EDF 2021 9,999,999.27 San Manuel, Isabela R.S.K.M. Construction Services Purok 1, Brgy. Camaal, Quirino, 9,899,193.73 9/27/2021 143 Calendar Days
Isabela
i f Sl P i | Pag- -N R Dr. Mario Dela F
27 |Construction of Slope Protection along Pag-asa - Narra Road 2,999,999.96 Echague, Isabela MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp. r- Mario Defa Fuente 2,996,224.14 9/27/2021 51 Calendar Days
- EDF 2021 Cabatuan, Isabela
Construction of Slope Protection along llagan - Divilacan Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
28 [Road (Sta 25+760 to Sta 25+860) - 5,000,000.00 llagan-Divilacan, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,994,755.31 9/27/2021 287 Calendar Days
EDF 2021 City of llagan, Isabela
A . ) , Dr. Mario Dela Fuente
29 |[Rehabilitation of Namnama - Villa Bello - EDF 2021 2,999,999.78 Jones, Isabela MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp. 2,996,661.22 9/27/2021 56 Calendar Days

Cabatuan, Isabela




No. Name of Project Approg:::ccitget L Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration
Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
30 [Rehabilitation of Quezon - Sto. Tomas Road - EDF 2021 2,999,999.89 Quezon, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 2,994,846.90 9/27/2021 52 Calendar Days
City of llagan, Isabela
31 |Rehabilitation of ict. National Benito Soliven - Capuseran - 2,999,999.38 Benito Soliven, Isabela YZK Builders Ms. Maria Loida C. Cruz 2,850,231.81 9/27/2021 | 56 Calendar Days
Zone ll, San Mariano, Isabela

Rogus Road - EDF 2021

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.
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