
No. Name of Project
Approved Budget for 

Contract
Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration

1 Construction of Supply Room Extension - Capital Outlay 2,000,000.00 Camberwell Construction & Supplies

Ms. Grace M. Rodriguez

Brgy. Magsaysay, Maharlika 

Highway, Naguilian, Isabela

1,997,231.48 10/26/2020 150 Calendar Days

2
Construction of Rescuer's Quarter with Two (2) 

Airconditioner Unit - Capital Outlay
1,500,000.00 Camberwell Construction & Supplies

Ms. Grace M. Rodriguez

Brgy. Magsaysay, Maharlika 

Highway, Naguilian, Isabela

1,460,739.53 10/26/2020 60 Calendar Days

3
Rehabilitation of Roofing and Ceiling at Manuel A. Roxas 

District Hospital - DBP Loan
13,269,371.31 SMT Construction

Mr. Samuel M. Toribio

Apitong St., Purok No. 1

Ilagan City, Isabela

13,261,225.11 11/3/2020 204 Calendar Days

4
Construction of Provincial Legislative Building (A Green 

Building) Phase 1 , Provincial Capitol Compound - PGO Co 1 - 

07 - 04 - 990 -18

91,835,768.29 MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp.
Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
91,798,161.44 11/16/2020 692 Calendar Days

5
Continuation of Barangay Community Center (Roofing)  - 

EDF 2020
153,835.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
- - 11/16/2020 7 Calendar Days

6 Construction of Multi Purpose Hall - EDF 2020 2,499,999.99 Camberwell Construction & Supplies

Ms. Grace M. Rodriguez

Brgy. Magsaysay, Maharlika 

Highway, Naguilian, Isabela

2,496,510.14 11/16/2020 141 Calendar Days

7
Construction of Multi Purpose Hall (Covered Court) - EDF 

2020
2,500,000.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

2,492,223.75 11/16/2020 107 Calendar Days

8 Construction of Multi Purpose Hall - EDF 2020 2,500,000.00 Camberwell Construction & Supplies

Ms. Grace M. Rodriguez

Brgy. Magsaysay, Maharlika 

Highway, Naguilian, Isabela

2,496,096.19 11/16/2020 180 Calendar Days

9 Construction of Multi Purpose Hall - EDF 2020 2,500,000.00 Camberwell Construction & Supplies

Ms. Grace M. Rodriguez

Brgy. Magsaysay, Maharlika 

Highway, Naguilian, Isabela

2,495,002.78 11/16/2020 180 Calendar Days

10
Construction of Slope Protection Along Ilagan - Divilacan 

Road (Sta. 40+720 - 40+885) - EDF AB 2019
6,925,886.28

City of Ilagan & 

Divilacan, Isabela
Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

6,920,464.92 11/16/2020 75 Calendar Days

11
Rehabilitation/Upgrading of Ilagan - Divilacan Provincial 

Road - CMGP 2020
35,190,824.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

35,185,219.79 11/23/2020 120 Calendar Days

12
Rehabilitation/Improvement of Jct. Nat'l. - Benito Soliven - 

Capuseran - Rogus - Provincial Road - CMGP 2020
24,300,748.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

24,294,952.44 11/23/2020 160 Calendar Days

San Antonio, Delfin Albano, 

Isabela

Brgy. Ammugauan, Sto. 

Tomas, Isabela

Brgy. Visitacion, Delfin 

Albano, Isabela

Brgy. Ragan Norte, Delfin 

Albano, Isabela

City of Ilagan, Isabela

Benito Soliven, Isabela

Brgy. Santa, Tumauini, Isabela
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Location

Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela

Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela

Roxas, Isabela

City of Ilagan, Isabela
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13
Rehabilitation/Improvement of Jones - San Guillermo 

Provincial Road - CMGP 2020
33,672,353.00 MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp.

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
33,664,594.21 11/23/2020 150 Calendar Days

14
Rehabilitation/Improvement of Sta. Maria - Sto. Tomas  

Provincial Road - CMGP 2020
26,163,710.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

26,157,617.91 11/23/2020 120 Calendar Days

15
Construction of Drainage Conduit, Cauayan National High 

School - EDF 2020
999,999.99 MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp.

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
996,717.33 12/1/2020 45 Calendar Days

16
Construction of Multi Purpose Brgy. Hall - EDF 

Reprogramming 2019
654,078.57 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

648,427.75 12/1/2020 41 Calendar Days

17
Construction of Multi Purpose Brgy. Hall - EDF 

Reprogramming 2019
1,245,182.35 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

1,239,217.21 12/1/2020 59 Calendar Days

18
Construction of Multi Purpose Brgy. Hall - EDF 

Reprogramming 2019
2,499,999.99 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

2,494,401.76 12/1/2020 138 Calendar Days

19
Construction of Multi Purpose Brgy. Hall - EDF 

Reprogramming 2019
2,499,999.99 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

2,493,953.80 12/1/2020 121 Calendar Days

20 Construction of Bubug Water System - EDF Reprogramming 2,500,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/17/2020 90 Calendar Days

21
Construction of Bagabag Water System - EDF 

Reprogramming
2,500,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/17/2020 90 Calendar Days

22
Construction of Bungad Water System - EDF 

Reprogramming
2,500,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/17/2020 90 Calendar Days

23
Construction of Ballacayu Water System - EDF 

Reprogramming
2,500,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/17/2020 90 Calendar Days

24
Construction of Water System, Sitio Cama, Simanu Norte - 

EDF Reprogramming
2,500,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/17/2020 90 Calendar Days

25 Construction of Balasig Water System - EDF Reprogramming 2,500,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/17/2020 90 Calendar Days

26
Construction of Magassi Water System - EDF 

Reprogramming
2,500,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/17/2020 90 Calendar Days

27
Construction of Water System, Sitio Gapa, San Antonio - 

EDF Reprogramming
2,500,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/21/2020 90 Calendar Days

Cabagan, Isabela

Cabagan, Isabela

Cabagan, Isabela

Brgy. Ragan Almacen, Delfin 

Albano, Isabela

Sto. Tomas, Isabela

Sto. Tomas, Isabela

San Pablo, Isabela

San Pablo, Isabela

San Pablo, Isabela

Brgy. Aneg, Delfin Albano, 

Isabela

Jones, Isabela

Sta. Maria, Isabela

Cauayan City, Isabela

Union, Cabagan, Isabela

Cansan, Cabagan, Isabela
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28
Construction of Water System, Sitio Annaronan, San 

Antonio - EDF Reprogramming
2,500,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/21/2020 90 Calendar Days

29
Construction of Bangag Water System - EDF 

Reprogramming
2,500,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/21/2020 90 Calendar Days

30
Construction of  Level II Water System at Massippi East and 

Massippi West - EDF 2020
4,999,999.99

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 12/21/2020 180 Calendar Days

31
Dredging of Creeks, Barangays of Sto. Tomas and Delfin 

Albano - EDF Reprogramming
47,705,384.00 EGB Construction

Ernie G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela

47,700,197.74 12/21/2020 512 Calendar Days

32 Construction of Multi Purpose Hall - EDF 2020 2,499,999.63 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

2,494,781.61 12/21/2020 120 Calendar Days

33
Construction of Liga ng mga Barangays ng Isabela Credit 

Cooperative Building - EDF 2020
1,999,999.99 A.F. Manuel Construction

Ms. Aurea F. Manuel

#58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02

San Mateo, Isabela

1,999,558.08 12/21/2020 90 Calendar Days

ENGR. VIRGILIO S. LORENZO   BAC Member

(SGD.) MS. ELSA M. PASTRANA
BAC Member

Sto. Tomas & Delfin Albano, 

Isabela

San Nicolas, Delfin Albano, 

Isabela

Cabagan, Isabela

Sta. Maria, Isabela

Cabagan, Isabela

Echague, Isabela

    BAC Member
(SGD.) MS. LUCILA M. AMBATALI

(SGD.) ENGR. VIRGILIO S. LORENZO
BAC  Chairman BAC Vice Chairman    BAC Member

(SGD.) MR. RODRIGO  T. SAWIT (SGD.) ATTY. JOHN RYAN P. TORIO

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.


