
No. Name of Project
Approved Budget for 

Contract
Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration

1 Renovation of Provincial Treasurer's Office - PGI 2,999,999.99 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

2,994,315.15 7/20/2020 113 Calendar Days

2
Repair of Water Tank Flooring at Milagros Albano District 

Hospital - PGI
106,469.04 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

105,100.00 7/20/2020 7 Calendar Days

3 Construction of Mabantad Multi-Purpose Hall - PGI 4,999,999.99 MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp.
Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
4,996,684.06 7/20/2020 120 Calendar Days

4
Cnstruction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building, 

Villa Teresita - PGI
296,303.29

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 7/21/2020 20 Calendar Days

5
Cnstruction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building, 

Echague District Hospital - PGI
296,303.29

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 7/21/2020 20 Calendar Days

6
Cnstruction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building, 

Manuel A. Roxas District Hospital - PGI
296,303.29

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 7/21/2020 20 Calendar Days

7
Cnstruction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building, 

Provincial Capitol Compound - PGI
296,303.29 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

294,147.88 7/21/2020 20 Calendar Days

8
Cnstruction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building, 

GFNDY Memorial Hospital - PGI
296,303.29 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

294,147.88 7/21/2020 20 Calendar Days

9
Cnstruction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building, 

San Mariano Community Hospital - PGI
296,303.29

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 7/21/2020 20 Calendar Days

10
Construction of Drainage Canal in front of Mabini National 

High School - PGI
84,976.33

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 7/21/2020 10 Calendar Days

11
Maintenance of Completed Union-Camasi Farm to Market 

Road - PGI
299,995.27 A. F. Manuel Construction

Ms. Aurea F. Manuel

#58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02

San Mateo, Isabela

297,059.49 8/10/2020 45 Calendar Days

12
Maintenance of Completed Olango-Siempre Viva-Trinidad-

Manano Farm to Market Road - PGI
299,998.81 A. F. Manuel Construction

Ms. Aurea F. Manuel

#58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02

San Mateo, Isabela

297,320.89 8/10/2020 38 Calendar Days

13
Maintenance of Completed District III-Sta. Cruz Farm to 

Market Road - PGI
299,999.42 A. F. Manuel Construction

Ms. Aurea F. Manuel

#58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02

San Mateo, Isabela

298,456.92 8/10/2020 43 Calendar Days

14
Maintenance of Completed San Placido-Sinamar Farm to 

Market Road - PGI
296,488.71 A. F. Manuel Construction

Ms. Aurea F. Manuel

#58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02

San Mateo, Isabela

293,709.38 8/10/2020 40 Calendar Days
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15
Construction of Bridge Connecting Brgys. Quezon, Quirino, 

Mansibang & Palattao - PGI
19,999,992.24 MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp.

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
19,991,944.37 8/10/2020 303 Calendar Days

16
Construction of Dimalama Bridge, Brgy. Burgos

 - PGI
9,999,998.72 MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp.

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
9,989,934.85 8/10/2020 312 Calendar Days

17
Construction of Dairy Microbiological Facility

 - PRDP
6,871,000.00 A.T. Dumlao Construction, Inc.

Mr. Pablo Yves L. Dumlao II

Brgy. Washington, Surigao City
6,865,607.40 8/25/2020 180 Calendar Days

18 Construction of Turod-Banquero Bridge - PGI 29,999,989.26 EGB Construction

Ernie G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela

29,949,005.14 9/28/2020 140 Calendar Days

19
Extension of Fencing of Provincial Senior Citizen Center - 

PGI
1,400,000.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply

Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz

Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd

City of Ilagan, Isabela

1,398,839.45 9/28/2020 95 Calendar Days
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