
No. Name of Project
Approved Budget for 

Contract
Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration

1
Rehabilitation/Upgrading of Ilagan-Divilacan Provincial 

Road (2nd Bid) - CMGP 2019
113,344,683.67 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

113,337,657.20 2/3/2020 354 Calendar Days

2
Upgrading of School Bldg. Roofing of Pagrang-Ayan 

Elementary School (2nd Bid) - SEF 2019
1,099,994.78

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/3/2020

60 Working 

Days

3
Completion of School Cottage at Dicamay Integrated School 

(2nd Bid) - SEF 2019
486,124.48

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/3/2020

90 Calendar 

Days

4
Construction of Rattan Processing Center Facility Phase I  - 

Reprogramming 2019
10,000,000.00

 Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/4/2020 454 Working Days

5
Improvement of Guard House at provincial Jail 

(2nd Bid) - PGO CO 2019
475,000.00

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/4/2020 45 Working Days

6
Improvement of Provincial Jail Building (Painting Works) 

(2nd Bid) - PGO CO 2019
1,252,000.00

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/4/2020 75 Working Days

7
Construction of Tilapia Fingerlings Production & Marketing 

Facilities - PRDP              
13,125,000.00 AHB Construction & Supply

Mr. Narciso L. Bilayon, Jr.

Cordon, Isabela
13,120,492.02 2/25/2020 180 Calendar Days

8
Construction of Brgy. Community Center, Brgy. Victoria (1st 

Bid) - EDF 2019
799,953.27

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/30/2020 29 Calendar Days

9
Reblocking of Quirino-Lullutan Road (Sta. Lucia Section) 

(2nd Bid) - EDF 2018
4,999,959.49

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/30/2020 60 Working Days

Pagrang-Ayan, Ramon, 

Isabela

Republic of the Philippines
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Location

Ilagan City, Isabela

San Mariano, Isabela

Ilagan City, Isabela

Capitol Compound, Ilagan 

City, Isabela

Ilagan City, Isabela

Wigan, Cordon, Isabela

Mallig, Isabela

Quirino, Isabela
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10
Construction of Drainage, Brgy. Samonte (2nd Bid)     - EDF 

2019
2,536,835.74

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/30/2020 120 Calendar Dyas

11
Construction of Evacuation Center, Brgy. Minagbag    (2nd 

Bid) - EDF 2019
999,908.67

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/30/2020

90 Calendar 

Days

12
Construction of Perimeter Fence at Don Mariano Marcos 

National High School (1st Bid) - SEF 2019
59,960.17

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/30/2020 18 Calendar Days

13
Repair of 4-CL Building at San Manuel Elementary School 

(1st Bid) - SEF 2019
199,935.47

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/30/2020

90 Calendar 

Days

14
Reblocking of San Luis-Villa Concepcion Road 

(2nd Bid) - EDF 2018
5,476,846.23

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/30/2020 60 Working Days

15
Repair of School Building at San Isidro West Elementary 

School (1st Bid) - SEF 2019
149,849.99

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/30/2020 30 Calendar Days

16
Repair of 8-CL Building and Improvement of Exisiting 2nd 

Floor of Multi-Purpose Bldg., San Agustin National High 

School (1st Bid) - SEF 2019

999,387.77
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/31/2020

90 Calendar 

Days

17
Construction of DRRM Office and School Clinic of Diadi 

Regiion High School, Villamarzo (1st Bid) - SEF 2019
499,170.83

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/31/2020 57 Working Days

18 Completion of Community Center (1st Bid) - EDF 2019 399,582.60
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/31/2020 30 Working Days

19
Construction of 1-CL Building at La Salette Elementary 

School (1st Bid) - SEF 2019
100,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/31/2020 20 Working Days

20 Construction of Dairy Barn (1st Bid) - EDF 2019 999,977.69
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/31/2020 60 Calendar Days

21
Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Hall (2nd Bid)

- EDF 2019
1,799,998.18

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/31/2020 90 Working Days

22
Construction of PDRRMC Command Center, Capitol 

Compound (1st Bid) - PGO CO
4,999,967.70

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/31/2020 120 Calendar Days

TOTAL 126,458,149.22              

ENGR. VIRGILIO S. LORENZO   BAC Member

Cauayan City, Isabela

Quezon, Isabela

Quezon, Isabela

Echague, Isabela

San Manuel, Echague, Isabela

San Antonio, Cabagan, 

Isabela

Villa Luz, Delfin Albano, 

Isabela

Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

San Isidro, Isabela

San Agustin, Isabela

Cordon, Isabela

Caloocan, San Agustin, 

Isabela

La Salette, Benito Soliven, 

Isabela
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