
No. Name of Project
Approved Budget for 

Contract
Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date

1
Rehabilitation, Build Back Better in Palanan Station 

Hospital - DOH
2,197,800.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 1/3/2019

2

Construction of ELC Tooth Brushing Area Storage Room and 

Landscape for Model Day Care Center - 

LDRRMF 2018 2-G

998,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 1/10/2019

3
Construction of Sea Wall Protection in Digumased (2nd Bid) 

-  LDRRMF 2018 
2,000,000.00

Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 1/10/2019

4

Construction of Old Capitol Perimeter Fence - 

 Capital Outlay 2018 10,000,000.00 Golden Tech Construction Corporation
Arch. Armando Tan

Raniag, Ramon, Isabela
9,919,695.08 1/10/2019

5
Improvement ofProvincial Jail (Extension) (Phase I)  -

 Capital Outlay 2018
5,000,000.00 FABRO Construction

Ms. Myra Calire Fabro Palmones

San Fernando City, La Union 
4,825,809.85 1/10/2019

6
Construction of Communal Sanitary Toilet in Sto. Tomas, 

National High School - LGSF-DOH
819,333.00 MC Taguba Construction

Mr. Manuel C. Taguba

Apostol St., Calamagui 1st, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

816,935.67 1/30/2019

7
Construction of Communal Sanitary Toilet in Calinaoan 

Elementary School - LGSF-DOH
819,333.00 MC Taguba Construction

Mr. Manuel C. Taguba

Apostol St., Calamagui 1st, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

816,935.67 1/30/2019

8
Construction of Communal Sanitary Toilet in Calanigan 

National High School - LGSF-DOH
819,333.00 MC Taguba Construction

Mr. Manuel C. Taguba

Apostol St., Calamagui 1st, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

816,935.67 1/30/2019

9
Construction of Proposed Mechanical Dryer Warehouse  - 

EDF 2018
7,980,000.00

MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
7,974,765.37 2/19/2019

10
Construction of Proposed Mechanical Dryer Warehouse  - 

EDF 2018
7,980,000.00 MC Taguba Construction

Mr. Manuel C. Taguba

Apostol St., Calamagui 1st, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

7,975,283.82 2/19/2019

Echague, Isabela

Cabagan, Isabela

Sto. Tomas, Isabela

Sto. Tomas, Isabela

Palanan, Isabela

Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela

Dinapigue, Isabela

City of Ilagan, Isabela

Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela

Sto. Tomas, Isabela
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11
Construction of Proposed Mechanical Dryer Warehouse  - 

EDF 2018
7,980,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/19/2019

12 Construction of NBI Detention Cell - Capital Outlay 2019 500,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/19/2019

13
Construction of Isabela Provincial Police Office (IPPO) Gym 

(Phase I)  - Capital Outlay 2019
1,808,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/19/2019

14
Construction of Line Canal Drainage at Balliao Elementary 

School - EDF 2019
104,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/19/2019

15
Repair of Provincial Engineering Office - Capital Outlay 

2019
300,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/19/2019

16
Repair and Improvement of Existing of Building for IP's 

Work Area - EDF 2019
207,200.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/19/2019

17 Rehabilitation of San Pedro Bridge Approaches  - EDF 2019 1,460,400.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/14/2019

18
Repair and Improvement of Existing of Building for IP's 

Work Area - EDF 2019
330,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/14/2019

19 Concreting of San Isidro Brgy. Road - EDF 2019 3,961,000.00
MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
383,821.26 2/14/2019

20
Construction of Two Storey Office Building of SWAD - 

SB No. 1 2018
5,000,000.00 SMT Construction

Mr. Samuel M. Toribio

Purok I, Bliss Village, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela

4,985,047.75 2/14/2019

21 Construction of Multi-Purpose Hall - EDF 2019 2,000,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/14/2019

22
Rehabilitation of Isabela Museum and Library Building  -  

Capital Outlay 2017
20,000,000.00

MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
19,994,975.55 2/14/2019

Mallig, Isabela

Dipudo, Divilacan, Isabela

Sindon Bayabo, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela

Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela

Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela

Calamagui 2
nd

,
 
 City of Ilagan, 

Isabela

San Mariano, Isabela

Calamagui 2
nd

,
 
 City of Ilagan, 

Isabela

Osmena, City of Ilagan,Isabela

San Isidro, Cauayan City, 

Isabela

Baligatan, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela

Benito Soliven, Isabela
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23
Completion of Echague Artificial Laboratory (2

nd
 Bid) - EDF 

Continuing 2018
206,715.25

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/14/2019

24
Provision of Water and Drainage System of Artificial 

Insemination Center  (2nd Bid) - EDF Continuing 2018
284,444.26

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/14/2019

25 Construction of Eight (8) Cells Dog Pound - EDF 2019 158,100.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/14/2019

26 Construction of Four (4) Cells Dog Pound  - EDF 2019 94,200.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/14/2019

27
Concreting of Cebu-San Isidro Provincial Road - 

EDF 2019
8,000,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/20/2019

28
Concreting of Old Provincial Road at Brgy. Old Centro

 - EDF 2019
8,000,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/20/2019

29
Concreting of FMR leading to SWIP Farm Area - 

EDF 2019
5,000,000.00 Golden Tech Construction Corporation

Arch. Armando Tan

Raniag, Ramon, Isabela
4,975,777.91 2/20/2019

30
Rehabilitation/Reblocking of Sandiat Centro Brgy. Road - 

EDF 2019
2,500,000.00 Isabela EBC Builders Construction Inc.

Mr. Jimmy T. Chua

Calao West, Santiago City,Isabela
2,497,230.97 2/20/2019

31
Rehabilitation/Reblocking of Sandiat West Brgy. Road  - 

EDF 2019
2,500,000.00 Isabela EBC Builders Construction Inc.

Mr. Jimmy T. Chua

Calao West, Santiago City,Isabela
2,497,230.97 2/20/2019

32 Concreting of Farm to Market Road (FMR) - EDF 2019 4,000,000.00
MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
3,993,723.00 2/20/2019

33 Concreting of Different Farm to Market Road - EDF 2019 5,000,000.00 Isabela EBC Builders Construction Inc.
Mr. Jimmy T. Chua

Calao West, Santiago City,Isabela
4,996,877.52 2/20/2019

34
Concrete Reblocking infront of Nungnungan I Elementary 

School to Community Center  - EDF 2019
6,000,000.00

MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
5,996,197.03 2/20/2019

Malibagu, Echague, Isabela

Brgy.Pisang, San Manuel, 

Isabela

Brgy. Tagaran, Cauayan 

City,Isabela

Malibagu, Echague, Isabela

San Manuel, Isabela

San Manuel, Isabela

City of Ilagan, Isabela

Brgy. Sto. Domingo, Quirino, 

Isabela

San Mateo, Isabela

San Isidro, Isabela

Echague, Isabela

Cauayan City, Isabela
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35
Concreting of Gappal-Manaoag-Linglingay Road - 

EDF 2019
55,000,000.00

First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 2/20/2019

36 Concreting of San Vicente-Barangay I Road - EDF 2019 5,000,000.00
MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
4,994,426.84 3/4/2019

37

Concreting of UnpavedPortion of Provincial Road along 

Minallo-Brgy. Flores  - EDF 2019 18,000,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 3/4/2019

38
Concreting of Brgy. Road at Purok 2, Villa Luna - 

EDF 2019
2,500,000.00

MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
2,495,899.88 3/4/2019

39

Concreting of Road Infront of Villa Concepcion High School-

Provincial Road - EDF 2019 2,500,000.00
MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
2,495,882.58 3/4/2019

40
Concreting of Road Network of Echague National High 

School  - EDF 2019
700,000.00

MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
696,255.79 3/4/2019

41 Concreting of Brgy. Road at Dicamay II - EDF 2019 5,000,000.00
MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
4,993,473.84 3/4/2019

42
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

43

Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR) in Colunguan, Antagan, Bubog and Barumbong  - 

LGSF

3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

44
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

45
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

46
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

Calamagui North, Santa 

Maria, Isabela

Cauayan City, Isabela

Calamagui East, Santa Maria, 

Isabela

Sto. Tomas, Isabela

Cansan, Cabagan, Isabela

Jones, Isabela

Echague, Isabela

Naguilian, Isabela

Jones, Isabela

Cauayan City, Isabela

Bangad, Sta. Maria, Isabela

Cauayan City, Isabela
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47
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

48
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

49
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

50
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

51
Rehabilitation/Improvement/Gravelling of Local Road 

(FMR)  - LGSF
3,000,000.00 EGB Construction

Engr. Erni G. Baggao

Maharlika Highway, Alibagu, City of 

Ilagan, Isabela

2,999,000.00 3/14/2019

52
Construction of Satellite Breeding Station Office at 

Municipal Compound - EDF 2018 Reprogramming
1,500,000.00

MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
1,496,391.17 3/18/2019

53
Construction of Piggery Building for 10 Sow Level -

 EDF 2018 Reprogramming
2,290,000.00

MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
2,284,702.85 3/18/2019

54 Construction of Goat House - EDF 2018 Reprogramming 660,000.00
MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
655,169.15 3/18/2019

55 Construction of Poultry House - EDF 2018 Reprogramming 750,000.00
MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
745,236.01 3/18/2019

56
Correcting of Gappal-Manaoag-Linglingay Road - EDF 2018 

Reprogramming
22,578,000.00

MAR-DEB Construction and Development 

Corporation

Dr. Mario Dela Fuente

Cabatuan, Isabela
22,572,227.43 3/18/2019

TOTAL 139,690,596.69              

(SGD) ATTY. EDUARDO R. CABANTAC
BAC MemberBAC Member

(SGD) ENGR.GIL V. AQUINO

San Isidro West, Santa Maria, 

Isabela

Echague, Isabela

Echague, Isabela

Echague, Isabela

Lingaling, Santa Maria, 

Isabela

 BAC Member

(SGD) DR. ANGELO C. NAUI

       BAC Member

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

(SGD) MS. CHERRY BAGAY-GREGORIO
BAC Member

(SGD) MS. FLORDELIZA L. GUIFAYA

San Antonio, Santa Maria, 

Isabela

Cauayan City, Isabela

Echague, Isabela

Calamagui West, Santa Maria, 

Isabela

BAC  Chairman BAC Vice Chairman
(SGD) MR. RODRIGO  T. SAWIT (SGD) ATTY. FRANCIS JAMES E. MEER

San Isidro East, Santa Maria, 

Isabela


