FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Republic of the Philippines
CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT
PROVINCE OF ISABELA

4™ Quarter, CY_ 2018

3 Forms to Use:

1. Bid Results on Civil Works

2. Bid Results on Goods and Services
3. Bid Results on Consulting Services

INDIVIDUAL BID-OUTS ARE NOT ALLOWED

Approved / Estimated

No. Name of Project Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date
Budget for Contract
1 Construction of P.rovmuarl Hemodialysis Cente_r at Gov. Faustino 19,999,561.19 City of llagan, Isabela Foref Construction Engr. Ferdmfand L. Ambatali 19,990,679.73 11/5/2018
N. Dy Sr. Memorial Hospital - Trust Fund - Excise Tax Brgy. Osmena, City of llagan, Isabela
) Repair of the Veterinary Clinic, Provincial Capitol Compound - 500,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela 4A's Construction Engr. Florep L. Ambatali 486,879.16 11/5/2018
EDF 2018 Calamagui 2nd, City of llagan, Isabela
. . . - . . Engr. Erni G, Baggao
Construct f Multi-P Building - 2018 EDF Tumauini National High
3 | onstruction of Multi-rurpose Buliding 3,500,000.00 onat fig EGB Construction Maharlika Highway, City of Ilagan, 3,498,994.29 11/5/2018
Reprogramming School, Tumauini, Isabela
Isabela
. . - - Engr. Erni G, Baggao
Construct f Multi-P Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. Bayabo, Tumauini,
g4 | -onstruction of Multi-Furpose Buliding 2,000,000.00 gy Bay EGB Construction Maharlika Highway, City of Ilagan, 1,998,798.75 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Isabela
Isabela
5 |Construction _°f Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF 2,500,000.00 Brgy. Santa, Tumauini, Isabela KWA Construction Mr. Kevin Rustom Cﬁ Valdepenas 2,464,185.50 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Bangad, Sta. Maria, Isabela
. . o . Engr. Erni G, Baggao
Construct f Multi-P Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. Lalauanan, Tumauini, . e .
g |-onstruction ot Multi-FUrpose Bullding 2,000,000.00 &Y EGB Construction Maharlika Highway, City of llagan, 1,998,936.70 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Isabela
Isabela
. . . - Engr. Erni G, Baggao
f Multi-P Buil - 2018 EDF Brgy. Lanna, Tumauini,
7 Construction .o ulti-Purpose Building 2,000,000.00 &Y EGB Construction Mabharlika Highway, City of llagan, 1,998,909.29 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Isabela
Isabela
. X Mr. Dominador L. Gutierrez
Constructi f Multi-P Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. San Isidro, Delfin
g | -onstruction ot MultirFurpose Euliding 2,500,000.00 & 969 Construction & Supplies #01 Everlasting Street, Brgy. San 2,469,733.40 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Albano, Isabela . ;
Vicente, Tarlac City
Constructi f Multi-P Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. Capitol, Delfin Albano, Mr. Peter S. P
g [-onstruction of Multi-Furpose Bullding 2,500,000.00 gy ~ap Atlantic Construction I Peter>. ua 2,492,962.32 11/5/2018

Reprogramming

Isabela

San Antonio, Delfin Albano, Isabela




Approved / Estimated

No. Name of Project Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date
Budget for Contract
. . Mr. Dominador L. Gutierrez
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF Brgy.Sto. Rosario, Delfin

10 uction ot Multi-Furpose Buflding 2,500,000.00 &y 969 Construction & Supplies #01 Everlasting Street, Brgy. San 2,469,175.88 11/5/2018

Reprogramming Albano, Isabela . N
Vicente, Tarlac City
i i- ilding - 2018 EDF Brgy. Calaocan, Delfin . i .

1 Constructlon‘of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 2,500,000.00 8y KWA Construction Mr. Kevin Rustom C. Valdepenas 2.464,780.04 11/5/2018

Reprogramming Albano, Isabela Bangad, Sta. Maria, Isabela
i f Multi-P Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. Aga, Delfin Albano, Mr. P . P

1p |Construction of Multi-Purpose Building 2,500,000.00 8Y- 18 Atlantic Construction Vir. Peter S. Pua 2,492,867.03 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Isabela San Antonio, Delfin Albano, Isabela
Constructi f Multi-P Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. Santor, Delfin Albano, Mr. Peter S. P

13 | onstruction of MUIL-FUrpose Bullding 2,500,000.00 &Y Atlantic Construction vir. Fever s. rua 2,492,268.03 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Isabela San Antonio, Delfin Albano, Isabela

. . Mr. Dominador L. Gutierrez
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF Brgy.Concepcion, Delfin

14 . P & 2,500,000.00 &Y P 969 Construction & Supplies #01 Everlasting Street, Brgy. San 2,469,632.22 11/5/2018

Reprogramming Albano, Isabela . i
Vicente, Tarlac City
i i- Building - 2018 EDF Brgy.San Jose, Delfin Albano, X i .

15 Constructlon.of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 2,500,000.00 8Y KWA Construction Mr. Kevin Rustom C. Valdepenas 2.464,746.35 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Isabela Bangad, Sta. Maria, Isabela
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Evacuation Center) - Brgy.Magassi, Cabagan, . . . . . . Mr. Elvin M. Ramos, Sr.

16 2,000,000.00 Elvin-K Constructi dE S 1,973,655.90 11/5/2018
2018 EDF Reprogramming e Isabela vin-kevin Lonstruction anc Engineering Services #195 Roxas Street, Cabagan, Isabela T /51
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Evacuation Center) - Brgy.San Antonio, Cabagan, . . . . . ) Mr. Elvin M. Ramos, Sr.

17 2,000,000.00 Elvin-Kevin Construction and Engineering Services 1,971,539.41 11/5/2018
2018 EDF Reprogramming Isabela g J #195 Roxas Street, Cabagan, Isabela /51

. . iIding - 2018 ED . -

18 ConstructlonAof Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF 2,000,000.00 Brgy. Cubag, Cabagan, Isabela Second- Failed Eldde N/A N/A 11/5/2018
Reprogramming (No bid submitted)

i f Multi-P Building - 2018 EDF Brgy.Auitan, San Pablo, Mr. Kevin R . Val

19 Constructlon.o ulti-Purpose Building 2,000,000.00 gy KWA Construction r. Kevin Rustom C. aldepenas 1,971,902.38 11/5/2018
Reprogramming Isabela Bangad, Sta. Maria, Isabela

20 Rehabilitation/Improvement of Provincial Agriculture Nursery 990,866.83 City of llagan, Isabela 4A's Construction Engr. Floren L. Ambatali 979,262.82 11/5/2018

(Phase I-1 Unit) - 2018 EDF

Calamagui 2nd, City of Ilagan, Isabela




Approved / Estimated

No. Name of Project Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date
Budget for Contract
Proposed Construction of Horse Stable and Fence (Tubular) - First Failed Bidding
21 700,000.00 Cabagan, Isabela . . N/A N/A 11/5/2018
2018 EDF Continuing & (No bid submitted) / / 5/
2 Construction of Aplaya Seawall Protection in Brgy. Aplaya - 2,000,000.00 Maconacon, Isabela First F.alled Blfjdlng N/A N/A 11/5/2018
LDRRMF 2018 (No bid submitted)
Construction of Seawall Protection in Digumased - LDRRMF N First Failed Bidding
23 2,000,000.00 Dinapigue, Isabela N/A N/A 11/5/2018
2018 Pl (No bid submitted) / / /51
Repair of Bisag Communal Irrigation System (CIS) in Sitio . First Failed Bidding
24 536,350.00 Brgy. Bisag, Palanan, Isabela N/A N/A 11/5/2018
Dikalaw - BUB &y & (No bid submitted) / / /51
. . o Brgy. Maligaya, Palanan, First Failed Bidding
25 (R fB C I tion Syst CIS) - BUB 532,500.00 . . N/A N/A 11/5/2018
epair of Bisag Communal Irrigation System (CIS) Isabela (No bid submitted) / / /5/
Mr. Dante S. Tapaoan
26 |Maintenance of Lingap Center for Street Children - 2018 EDF 474,000.00 Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela DST Metalcraft and Engineering Works Maharlika Highway, Cauayan City, 468,329.02 11/5/2018
Isabela
L Engr. Erni G, Baggao
Rehabilitat f Isabel ts C lex - 2018 EDF . .
27 |Rehabilitation of Isabela Sports Complex 50,000,000.00 Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela EGB Construction Maharlika Highway, City of llagan, 49,998,579.74 11/8/2018
Reprogramming
Isabela
Construction of One (1) Storey Maintenance/Stockroom for . MAR-DEB Construction and Development Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
28 13,500,000.00 City of Cauayan Isabela . . ) 13,493,574.92 11/8/2018
Pharmacy/Medical Records and Janitorial Supplies - DOH (HFEP) v v Corporation National Highway, Cabatuan, Isabela 18/
. . . . 201 _ ) . —
29 Maintenance and Repair of Women's Protection Center - 2018 495,556.79 City of llagan, Isabela First Ealled Blf’jdlng N/A N/A 11/8/2018
EDF (No bid submitted)
Mr. Rodrigo C. Colbongan
30 [Construction of Mungbean Warehouse with Solar Dryer - PRDP 7,000,000.00 San Mateo, Isabela Colby Construction Maharlika Highway, Batal, Santiago 6,997,000.00 12/14/2018
City, Isabela
Mr. Rodrigo C. Colbongan
. . Dona Concha, Roxas, . . . .
31 [Construction of Mungbean Warehouse with Solar Dryer - PRDP 12,542,000.00 Colby Construction Maharlika Highway, Batal, Santiago 12,537,000.00 12/14/2018

Isabela

City, Isabela




Approved / Estimated

No. Name of Project Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date
Budget for Contract
Brgy. District 3, Gamu, Mr. Ji T.Ch
32 [Construction of Warehouse with Solar Dryer - PRDP 12,266,000.00 &y Isabela EBC Builders Construction, Inc. r |mm}/ .ua 12,264,213.25 12/14/2018
Isabela Calao West, Santiago City, Isabela

Construction and Repair of Mezzanine and Ceiling Joist at the . . First Failed Bidding

33 1,556,700.00 Alibagu, City of llagan, Isabela N/A N/A 12/11/2018
Assessor's Office - PGO CO & v & (No bid submitted) / / 11
Maintenance and Repair of Women's Protection Center (Social : Second Failed Bidding

34 495,556.79 City of llagan, Isabela N/A N/A 12/11/2018
Welfare Services) - 2018 EDF Y & (No bid submitted) / / 1/
Proposed Construction of Horse Stable and Fence (Tubular) - . . ) . ) ) Mr. Elvin M. Ramos, Sr.

35 700,000.00 Cabagan, Isabela Elvin-K Constructi dE S ! 689,892.18 12/19/2018
2018 EDF Continuing & vin-fevin Lonstruction and tngineering ervices #195 Roxas Street, Cabagan, Isabela 119/

[ [ -201 , . : i

36 ENRO Nursery Perimeter Fence at the Capitol Compound - 2018 1,000,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela 4A's Construction Engr Florep L. Ambatali 908,316.76 12/21/2018
EDF Calamagui 2nd, City of llagan, Isabela
Construction of Warehouse for Rattan Processing - First Failed Bidding

37 7,000,000.00 . X N/A N/A 12/21/2018
2018 PCF (No bid submitted) / / /21
Construction of Physical Fitness Area for Senior Citizen at the . . Engr. Floren L. Ambatali

38 500,000.00 City of Ilagan, Isabela 4A's Construct 493,413.79 12/21/2018
Capitol Compound - 2018 EDF v & s Lonstruction Calamagui 2nd, City of llagan, Isabela /21
TOTAL 157,000,228.86
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