FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Republic of the Philippines
GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

PROVINCE OF ISABELA

at Quarter, CY

No.

Item Description

Approved Budget for
Contract

Winning Bidder

Name and Address Of Bidder

Contract Amount

Date of Bidding

Eight (8) Units of Portable Hybrid Solar/Battery
12 Volts Powered with Water Treatment
System

3,840,000.00

SAMONE Trading

Mr. Roberto R. Samson
419-D, A. Mabini St., Brgy. 20,
Caloocan City.

3,839,500.00

11/5/2018

Supply and Delivery of 3 Ft. Bamboo Propagules
(90,072 pcs.), Narra Seedlings (45,036 pcs.),
Molave Seedlings (45,036 pcs.), Tuai Seedlings
(30,024 pcs.), Grafted Rambutan Seedlings
16,200 pcs.), Grafted Mango Seedlings (4,050
pcs.), Coconut Seedling (21,600 pcs.), Grafted
Sweet Pomelo Seedlings (13,500 pcs.), and
Tibbing Seedlings (10,800 pcs.)

9,386,820.00

Association of Bicolanos for Environmental

Protection, Inc.

Beryl A. Alvarez
#50 Dimasalang Street, Sta. Cruz,
Naga City

8,386,820.00

11/6/2018

Supply and Delivery of 235,382 Kg. Organic
Fertilizer

2,353,820.00

First Failed Bidding
(No bid submitted)

N/A

N/A

11/6/2018

Labor for Site Preparation and Plantation
Maintenance, such as: Ring Weeding,
Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and Fertilizer
Application of 20% Mortality of 250 Hectare

Area (1% Year)

11,052,720.00

First Failed Bidding
(No bid submitted)

N/A

N/A

11/6/2018

Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and
Fertilizer Application of 10% Mortality of 250

Hectare Area (2™ Year)

2,817,180.00

First Failed Bidding
(No bid submitted)

N/A

N/A

11/6/2018




Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and
Fertilizer Application of 10% Mortality of 250

Hectare Area (3"Year)

2,609,670.00

First Failed Bidding
(No bid submitted)

N/A

N/A

11/6/2018

Supply and Delivery ot 3 Ft. Narra Seedlings
(45,036 pcs.), Molave Seedlings (45,036 pcs.),
Tuai Seedlings (30,024 pcs.), Ipil Seedlings
(22,518 pcs.), Dao Seedlings (7,506 pcs.) Rattan
Seedlings (54,000 pcs.) and Dipterocarp sp
Seedlings (90,072 pcs.)

7,167,150.00

Joan Venturina's Plant Nursery

Joan Venturina
Curva, Puncan, Carranglan, Nueva
Ecija

6,178,032.00

11/6/2018

Supply and Delivery of 250,608 kg. Organic
Fertilizer

2,506,080.00

First Failed Bidding
(No bid submitted)

N/A

N/A

11/6/2018

Labor for Plantation Site Preparation,
Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and
Fertilizer Application of 20% mortality and
Protection, such as: establishment of firelines
and construction of look-out towers of a 200

hectare area (1% Year)

12,967,680.00

Association of Bicolanos for Environmental
Protection, Inc.

Beryl A. Alvarez
#50 Dimasalang Street, Sta. Cruz,
Naga City

12,960,000.00

11/6/2018

10

Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and
Fertilizer Application of 10% mortality of a 200

hectare area (2" Year)

2,941,920.00

First Failed Bidding
(No bid submitted)

N/A

N/A

11/6/2018

11

Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and
Fertilizer Application of 5% mortality of a 200

hectare area (3™ Year)

2,778,480.00

First Failed Bidding
(No bid submitted)

N/A

N/A

11/6/2018




Labor for Plantation Site Preparation,
Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and

First Failed Bidding

12 |Fertilizer Application of 20% mortality and 10,599,680.00 . . N/A N/A 11/6/2018
. . _ (No bid submitted)
Protection, such as: establishment of firelines
and construction of look-out towers of a 160
hectare area (1% Year)
Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and First Failed Bidding
13 Fertilizer Application of 10% mortality of a 160 2,401,920.00 (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 11/6/2018
hectare area (2" Year)
Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and First Failed Bidding
14 Fertilizer Application of 5% mortality of a 200 2,268,480.00 (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 11/6/2018
hectare area (3™ Year)
. . . Ms. Jomarie N. Tugo
Midway Drug and Medical Supplies Bray. Osmena, City og llagan, Isabela 1,509,500.00 11/14/2018
Ms. Elvie E. Espino
Medical Gallery Trading Co. 1357 Rizal Avenue, Sta. Cruz, Manila 599,000.00 11/14/2018
Ms. Irish Jane T. Cristobal
Isaiah 8:15 Enterprises #60 Rizal Avenue, District Il (Pob) 3,195,522.40 11/14/2018
Cauayan City, Isabela
Ms. Roselle S. Co
RANA Pharmaceutical, inc. 1465 E Rodriguez Avenue, 500,650.00 11/14/2018
Quezon City
Ms. Rosalinda R. Pagulayan
13 Supply and Delivery of Drugs and Medicines 10,000,000.00 KRP Enterprises 37 Taft Street, Brgy. Sta. Barbara 1,002,915.00 11/14/2018
City of llagan, Isabela
Ms. Malou P. Pascua
RLT Drug Purok #2, Narra St., Bliss Village 499,453.00 11/14/2018

City of llagan, Isabela




Mr. Fernando P. Requinio

Ferma Drug Enterprises City Road, Dubinan East 996,240.00 11/14/2018
Santiago City, Isabela
Ms. Ma. Cristina April S.
Euro Med Laboratories, Philippines, Inc. > Ve Cns_tma prl. 5. Santos 1,000,704.00 11/14/2018
Ermita, Manila
Mr. Honorio C. T
Multi-Gas Corporation . y 696,000.00 11/14/2018
Alicia, Isabela
. . . Ms. Jomarie N. Tugo
Midway Drug and Medical Supplies Bray. Osmena, City og llagan, Isabela 2,505,200.00 11/14/2018
Ms. Elvie E. Espino
Medical Gallery Trading Co. 1357 Rizal Avenue, Sta. Cruz, Manila 979,700.00 11/14/2018
Ms. Irish Jane T. Cristobal
14 Supply and Delivery of Medical Supplies 10,000,000.00 Isaiah 8:15 Enterprises #60 Rizal Avenue, District Il (Pob) 3,091,520.00 11/14/2018
Cauayan City, Isabela
Ms. Roselle S. Co
RANA Pharmaceutical, inc. 1465 E Rodriguez Avenue, 2,220,993.50 11/14/2018
Quezon City
Ms. Malou P. Pascua
RLT Drug Purok #2, Narra St., Bliss Village 1,202,120.00 11/14/2018
City of llagan, Isabela
Supply and Delivery of 235,382 Kg. Organic Mr. Paul C.Pecjo
15 |2UPPY very 202 K. Drgant 2,353,820.00 Richfield Agrifarms Trading Incorporated " ) 2,351,466.18 12/11/2018
Fertilizer Paralayunan,Mabalacat, Pampanga
Labor for Site Preparation and Plantation
Maintenance, such as: Ring Weeding, Mr Mark Looe H. H d
16 |cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and Fertilizer 11,052,720.00 Lucky Charms Trading r-Viark tope . Hernandez 11,012,000.00 12/11/2018
L . Sampaloc, Talisay, Batangas
Application of 20% Mortality of 250 Hectare
Area (1% Year)
Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and Mr.Mark L H.H d
17 & 8 Replanting 2,817,180.00 Lucky Charms Trading r-viark tope 1. Hernandez 2,797,000.00 12/11/2018

Fertilizer Application of 10% Mortality of 250
Hectare Area (2™ Year)

Sampaloc, Talisay, Batangas




Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and

Mr.Mark Lope H. Hernandez

18 Fertilizer Application of 10% Mortality of 250 2,609,670.00 Lucky Charms Trading Sampaloc, Talisay, Batangas 2,583,000.00 12/11/2018
Hectare Area (3"Year)
. . Mr. Paul C.Pecjo
19 [Supply and Delivery of 250,608 kg. Organic 2,506,080.00 Richfield Agrifarms Trading Incorporated " ) 2,503,573.92 12/11/2018
Fertilizer Paralayunan,Mabalacat, Pampanga
Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and Mr.Mark Lope H. Hernandez
. Lucky Ch Tradi .
20 Fertilizer Application of 10% mortality of a 200 2,941,920.00 ucky Charms Trading Sampaloc, Talisay, Batangas 2,921,000.00 12/11/2018
hectare area (2" Year)
Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and . Mr.Mark Lope H. Hernandez
21 Fertilizer Application of 5% mortality of a 200 2,778,480.00 Lucky Charms Trading Sampaloc, Talisay, Batangas 2,758,000.00 12/11/2018
hectare area (3™ Year)
Labor for Plantation Site Preparation,
Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and ) o
27 |Fertilizer Applicati o . Second Failed Bidding
pplication of 20% mortality and 10,599,680.00 . . N/A N/A 12/11/2018
. ) X Lo (No Bid Submitted)
Protection, such as: establishment of firelines
and construction of look-out towers of a 160
hectare area (1% Year)
Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and . Mr.Mark Lope H. Hernandez
23 Fertilizer Application of 10% mortality of a 160 2,401,920.00 Lucky Charms Trading Sampaloc, Talisay, Batangas 2,381,000.00 12/11/2018
hectare area (2" Year)
Labor for Plantation Maintenance, such as: Ring
Weeding, Cultivation, Hauling, Replanting and . Mr.Mark Lope H. Hernandez
24 Fertilizer Application of 5% mortality of a 160 2,268,480.00 Lucky Charms Trading Sampaloc, Talisay, Batangas 2,248,000.00 12/11/2018
hectare area (3™ Year)
. Mr. Eliseo M. Ong
S I d Del f 22 Sets of CCTV C
g5 [PUPPIY and DEIVEry of 22 5ets o ameras!  10,000,000.00 | Techview Enterprises #63 Dona Fronnie Street San Fermin, 9,900,500.00 12/19/2018
including labor/Installation .
Cauayan City, Isabela
Suppl d Deli f Medical Suppli d Ms. ieN.T
26 |2UPPIYandelivery ot Medical supplies an 4,601,052.00 Midway Drug and Medical Supplies s Jomarie N. Tugo 4,601,052.00 12/19/2018

Equipment

Brgy. Osmena, City og llagan, Isabela




Supply and Delivery of Two (2) Units of 4x4 Pick-

First Failed Bidding

27 |Up, 2.8 L, Diesel, M/T with 3 Years LTO 3,126,400.00 . . N/A N/A 12/19/2018
. ] (No bid submitted)
Registration
Suppl d Deli fS 7) Units of AUV,
UPPly and Delivery o eve.n (7) Units o First Failed Bidding
28 |1.51L, Gas, A/T, 7 Seaters with 3 Years LTO 7,879,900.00 , , N/A N/A 12/19/2018
. . (No bid submitted)
Registration
Supply and Delivery of Three (3) Units of AUV,
FB Body, Dual AC, Shuttle Body, 2500cc CRDI, 4 First Failed Bidding
29 3,570,000.00 . . N/A N/A 12/19/2018
Cylinder, Diesel, M/T, Brand New with 3 Years (No bid submitted) / / 119/
LTO Registration
Supply and Delivery of Binder with Bolt and . .
L . Ms. Teresita S. Laggui
30 |Nuts, Assessment Roll Taxable, Record of 3,937,000.00 TSL Printing and General Mechandise . ) 3,937,000.00 12/21/2018
) Minante |, Cauayan City, Isabela
Assessment and Ownership Record Card
Two (2) Units of Brand New AUV, with 2500cc . . o
. . . First Failed Bidding
31 |CRDI, 4 Cylinder, Diesel, M/T with 3 Years LTO 2,380,000.00 . . N/A N/A 12/21/2018
. . (No bid submitted)
Registration
TOTAL 101,363,462.00

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

(SGD) MR. RODRIGO T. SAWIT
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(SGD) ENGR. VIRGILIO S. LORENZO
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(SGD) MS. CHERRY BAGAY-GREGORIO
BAC Member

(SGD) ATTY. FRANCIS JAMES E. MEER

BAC Vice-Chairman

(SGD) MS. ELSA M. PASTRANA
BAC Member

ATTY. NOEL MANUEL R. LOPEZ

BAC Member

(SGD) DR. ANGELO C. NAUI

BAC Member




