
FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

No. Item Description
Approved Budget for 

Contract
Winning Bidder Name and Address Of Bidder Bid Amount Date of Bidding

1 Cement 2,208,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 7/11/2018

2 Procurement of Hydraulics - Hydraulics 2,500,000.00 Palmer-Asia, Incorporated
Mr. Patrick O. Perilla

#33 Edsa Bangkal, Makati City
2,495,000.00 7/11/2018

3 ELF Brandnew NPC 4x4 Dropside 14 Feet 2,400,000.00 BM Domingo Motors

Mr. Danilo E.Joven

349 Maharlika Highway, San Fermin, 

Cauayan City, Isabela

2,388,500.00 8/8/2018

4 Termite Control 1,808,700.00 Kapitan Pepe Pest Control
Ms. Elizabeth Mercado

Cabatuan City, Nueva Ecija
1,718,265.00 8/28/2018

5
Landscape of the Queen Isabela Park, City of 

Ilagan,Isabela
6,860,575.00 Nikel Construction and Trading Mr. Nicasio A. Eder Jr.

San Fermin, Cauayan City, Isabela

6,854,200.00 8/28/2018

6 Cement 2,208,000.00
Second Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 8/28/2018

7

One (1) Mini Dump Truck 2.5 cu.m. 4 Cylinder 

Turbo Inter Cooler Common Rail Direct 

Injection Diesel Engine Emission Standard - 

Euro 4

1,500,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 9/7/2018

8 Rice Harvester and Rice Straw Baler 3,800,000.00 Agri Component

Mr. Marvin Rey B.Ramirez

National Highway, Tagaran, Cauayan 

City, Isabela

3,798,000.00 9/19/2018

9

Eight (8) Units of Portable Hybrid Solar/Battery

12 Volts Powered with Water Treatment 

System

3,840,000.00
First Failed Bidding

(No bid submitted)
N/A N/A 9/19/2018
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10
Supply and Delivery of 313 Boxes of Canned 

Tuna
433,500.00 Y Cube Enterprises

Mr. Gilbert B. Ceralde

Rizal St. San Vicente, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela
433,192.00 9/26/2018

11
Supply and Delivery of 313 Boxes of Canned 

Corned Beef
658,865.00 Y Cube Enterprises . 658,552.00 9/26/2018

12
Supply and Delivery of 313 Boxes of Canned 

Meat Loaf
463,533.00 Y Cube Enterprises

Mr. Gilbert B. Ceralde

Rizal St. San Vicente, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela
463,240.00 9/26/2018

13
Supply and Delivery of 695 Packs of Coffee (36 

Pcs. Per Pack)
243,250.00 Y Cube Enterprises

Mr. Gilbert B. Ceralde

Rizal St. San Vicente, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela
242,555.00 9/26/2018

14
Supply and Delivery of 5,000 Pcs. of Large 

Plastic Bags
15,000.00 Y Cube Enterprises

Mr. Gilbert B. Ceralde

Rizal St. San Vicente, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela
14,750.00 9/26/2018

15
Supply and Delivery of 5,000 Pcs. of Medium 

Plastic Bags
12,500.00 Y Cube Enterprises

Mr. Gilbert B. Ceralde

Rizal St. San Vicente, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela
12,250.00 9/26/2018

16 Supply and Delivery of 500 Pcs. of Sacks 7,500.00 Y Cube Enterprises

Mr. Gilbert B. Ceralde

Rizal St. San Vicente, City of Ilagan, 

Isabela
7,250.00 9/26/2018

TOTAL 19,085,754.00 
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