FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Republic of the Philippines
CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT
PROVINCE OF ISABELA

3rd

Quarter, CY _ 2018

3 Forms to Use:

1. Bid Results on Civil Works

2. Bid Results on Goods and Services
3. Bid Results on Consulting Services

INDIVIDUAL BID-OUTS ARE NOT ALLOWED

Approved / Estimated

No. Name of Project Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Bid Amount Bidding Date
Budget for Contract
1 Constru.ctlon of Aromatic & Pigmented Rice Production & 7.663,000.00 Cabarogguis, Quirino IMD-68 Builders Dlosdadg EIerllaf 7.653,000.00 7/31/2018
Marketing Warehouse - PRDP Cabarroguis, Quirino
) Construction of Multi-Purpose Building at the Provincial Capitol 4,999,592.05 Alibagu, City of Ilagan, Isabela SMT Construction . I.Engr. Sa.muel M.Torio 4,994,434.80 7/31/2018
Compound - EDF Bliss Village,City of llagan, Isabela
. i Engr. Erni G. Baggao
3 |Road Concreting along the Provincial Government Center (Phase 14,999,638.09 EGB Construction Maharlika Highway, City of Ilagan, 14,998,616.05 7/31/2018
3), Capitol Compound - EDF sabel
Alibagu, City of llagan, Isabela sabela
First Failed Biddi
4 |Completion of Echague Artificial Insemination Laboratory - EDF 206,715.25 (,'\‘r; biZ';bn:itt'e';g) N/A N/A 7/31/2018
Malibagu, Echague, Isabela
5 Prows.lon f)f Water System and Drainage System of Artificial 284,444.26 Malibagu, Echague, Isabela First F.alled Blf:ldmg N/A N/A 7/31/2018
Insemination Center - EDF (No bid submitted)
Bolinao Sports Complex, Sto. First Failed Bidding
6 i i ileti i BUB 800,000.00 . ) 8/8/2018
Construction of Communal Sanitary Toilet in Bolinao BU Tomas, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A /8/.
Repair of Ceiling of Grade 1 & 2 Rooms at Dabubu Grande . First Failed Bidding
7 50,026.08 San Agustin, Isabela N/A N/A 8/8/2018
Elementary School - SEF & (No bid submitted) / / /8/
. - S . First Failed Bidding
8 Construction of I?rovmcgl Hemodialysis Center at Gov. Faustino 19,999,561.19 llagan City, Isabela (Bidder's are declared disqualified during post- N/A N/A 8/8/2018
N. Dy Sr. Memorial Hospital - Trust Fund - Excise Tax L
qualification stage)
13 Céns.tructlon.of a 50-Bed Capacity Extension Bldg. for Cauayan 19,995,165.95 Cauayan City,| sabela MAR-DEB Construction 'and Development Dr. Marlo P Dela Fuente 19,987,882.63 8/28/2018
District Hospital -Trust Fund Corporation National Higway, Cabatuan, Isabela
i f -Bi ity E ion Bldg. for Mil Mr. R T.C
14 |Construction of a 50-Bed Capacity Extension Bldg. for Milagros 19,979,716.44 Cabagan,lsabela RSKC Construction r. Raymund T.Cababa 19,798,350.28 8/28/2018
Albano, District Hospital - Trust Fund Sto. Tomas, Isabela
S d Failed Biddi
15  |Rehabilitation of the Port/Rock Causeway in Culasi Port - BUB 3,294,000.00 Palanan, Isabela econd Fatled bldding N/A N/A 8/28/2018

(No bid submitted)




Approved / Estimated

No. Name of Project Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Bid Amount Bidding Date
Budget for Contract

Repair of the Veterinary Clinic, Provincial Capitol Compound - . First Failed Bidding

16 500,000.00 llagan City, Isabela . ) N/A N/A 8/29/2018
EDF 2018 & ¥ (No bid submitted) / / /29/
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF Tumauini National High First Failed Bidding

17 X .. 8/29/2018
Reprogramming 2,140,000.00 School, Tumauini, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A /29/

i i- Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. Bayabo, Tumauini, i iled Biddi

18 Constructlon.of Multi-Purpose Building 1,014,100.00 gy. Bay First F.alled |f:ld|ng N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming Isabela (No bid submitted)

19 Constructlon_of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF 1,705,100.00 Brgy. Santa, Tumauini, Isabela First falled qudmg N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming (No bid submitted)

20 Construction_of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF 1,014,100.00 Brgy. Lalauanan, Tumauini, First failed Bifﬂding N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming Isabela (No bid submitted)

2 Construction_of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF 1,014,100.00 Brgy. Lanna, Tumauini, First Eailed Bigding N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming Isabela (No bid submitted)
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. San Isidro, Delfin First Failed Bidding

22 2,141,000.00 N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming e Albano, Isabela (No bid submitted) / / /291

23 Construction_of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF 2,448,600.00 Brgy. Capitol, Delfin Albano, First Eailed Bifiding N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming Isabela (No bid submitted)
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF Brgy.Sto. Rosario, Delfin First Failed Bidding

24 2,187,900.00 . X N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming Albano, Isabela (No bid submitted) / / /29/
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF Brgy. Calaocan, Delfin First Failed Bidding

25 2,444, . N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming /444,900.00 Albano, Isabela (No bid submitted) / / /29/

2 Construction_of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF 2,419,400.00 Brgy. Aga, Delfin Albano, First failed Bifﬂding N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming Isabela (No bid submitted)

27 Construction.of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF 1,505,600.00 Brgy.Santor, Delfin Albano, First F.ailed Bifjding N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming Isabela (No bid submitted)
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - 2018 EDF Brgy.Concepcion, Delfin First Failed Bidding

28 1,992 X 8/29/2018
Reprogramming ,992,500.00 Albano, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 129/

29 Construction of Multi-Purpose Building - C 2018 EDF 1,995,700.00 Brgy.San Jose, Delfin Albano, First Failed Bidding N/A N/A 8/29/2018

Reprogramming

Isabela

(No bid submitted)




Approved / Estimated

No. Name of Project Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Bid Amount Bidding Date
Budget for Contract
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Evacuation Center) - Brgy.Magassi, Cabagan, First Failed Bidding
30 2 X 8/29/2018
2018 EDF Reprogramming /000,000.00 Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 129/
Construction of Multi-Purpose Building (Evacuation Center) - Brgy.San Antonio, Cabagan, First Failed Bidding
31 1,647,200.00 . X N/A N/A 8/29/2018
2018 EDF Reprogramming Isabela (No bid submitted) / / /291
i i-P Building - 2018 EDF Brgy.Auitan, San Pablo, i i Biddi
32 Constructlon.of Multi-Purpose Building 1,392,700.00 8y First F.alled |f:ld|ng N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming Isabela (No bid submitted)
i i-P Building - 2018 EDF i i Biddi
33 Constructlon.of Multi-Purpose Building 1,944,000.00 Bray. Cubag, Cabagan, Isabela First F.alled |f:ld|ng N/A N/A 8/29/2018
Reprogramming (No bid submitted)
N First Failed Bidding
. . Brgy. District 3, Gamu, . , . e .
Construction of Warehouse with Solar Dryer - PRDP 12,266,000.00 lsabela (Bidder's are declared disqualified during post- N/A N/A 9/7/2018
qualification stage)
. X . . Mr. Narciso L. Bilayon, Jr.
Construction of Warehouse with Solar Dryer - PRDP 12,266,000.00 San Fabian, Echague, Isabela AHB Construction and Supply Cordon. Isabela 12,211,813.00 9/7/2018
Brev. Dona Concha. Roxas First Failed Bidding
Construction of Warehouse with Solar Dryer - PRDP 12,542,000.00 &Y. Isabela ! ! (Bidder's are declared disqualified during post- N/A N/A 9/7/2018
qualification stage)
Second Failed Bidding
Construction of Mungbean Warehouse with Solar Dryer - PRDP 7,000,000.00 San Mateo, Isabela (Bidder's are declared disqualified during post- N/A N/A 9/7/2018

qualification stage)

TOTAL

67,432,283.76

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.
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