FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Republic of the Philippines
CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT
PROVINCE OF ISABELA

1% Quarter, CY _2018

3 Forms to Use:

1. Bid Results on Civil Works

2. Bid Results on Goods and Services

3. Bid Results on Consulting Services
INDIVIDUAL BID-OUTS ARE NOT ALLOWED

Approved Budget for

No. Name of Project P Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Bid Amount Bidding Date
Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
1  |Reblocking of Minante - Nagrumbuan Provincial Road - EDF 2,207,186.42 Cauayan City, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 2,205,836.46 1/25/2018
Isabela
. . . - Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
2 Eg:cretlng of Sta. Luciana - San Antonio Provincial Road - 4,976,570.64 Cauayan City, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 4,973,866.46 1/25/2018
Isabela
Construction of Concrete Fence of Artificial Insemination Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
3 Bldg. - EDF 394,800.00 Malibagu, Echague, Isabela (Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 394,197.19 1/25/2018
& Isabela
. Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
. . Burgos, San Guiilermo, X . i
4 |Construction of Foot Bridge & 3-Barrel 3mx3m RCBC - EDF 3,177,700.00 Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 3,173,040.07 1/25/2018
Isabela
. o . Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
5 Construction ol1"5:85mx1'1.00m Provincial Enro Vermi 484,113.11 llagan City, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 480,113.01 1/25/2018
Composed Facilities Capitol Compound - EDF
Isabela
- Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
i . ith li Tagaran, Cauayan City,
6 Construction of Double Barrel Box Culvert 2.0m with lined 1,230,700.00 & v v Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 1,228,036.98 1/25/2018
Canal - EDF Isabela
Isabela
Mr. Rodrigo C. Colbongan
7 |Concreting of Arubub-Addalam-Tupax Road - EDF 9,999,995.33 Jones, Isabela Colby Construction #121 Purok Namnama, Batal, 9,994,376.76 3/15/2018
Santiago City, Isabela
Brgy. Caloocan, San Agustin, Mr. Ariel B. Ordinario
8 |Concreting of Farm to Market Road - EDF 9,999,992.72 ’ Isabéla " |Armson Construction and Enterprises #34 Dona Fronie Ave., San Fermin, 9,980,442.37 3/15/2018
Cauayan City, Isabela
. . . Mr. Rodrigo C. Colbongan
g |Construction of Additional 4-Span Sinalugan -Concrete 9,999,038.38 San Guillermo, Isabela | Colby Construction #121 Purok Namnama, Batal, 9,993,716.70 3/15/2018
Overflow Bridge - EDF . .
Santiago City, Isabela
Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
10 |Completion of Community Center - EDF 4,999,858.18 San Mateo, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 4,994,608.38 3/15/2018
Isabela
Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
11 |Road Concreting of Brgy. Rang-Ay - EDF 4,999,995.38 San Agustin, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 4,984,098.68 3/15/2018
Isabela
12 |Rehabilitation of Burgos-Quirino Provincial Road - EDF 10,000,272.46 Burgos, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/15/2018
I . . - Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
13 E;’;abmtatlon of San Guillermo-Pigalo Provincial Road - 20,000,049.38 San Guillermo, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 19,980,324.60 3/15/2018
Isabela
Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
14 | Concreting of Panang Brgy. Road - EDF 4,999,974.70 San Agustin, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 4,983,624.74 3/15/2018
Isabela
Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
15 |Road Concreting of Pinoma Brgy. Road at Purok 5 - EDF 3,499,998.22 Cauayan City, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 3,494,903.61 3/15/2018
Isabela
Concreting of San Fermin-National Highway Tagaran Dr. Mario P. Dela Fuente
16 8 ghway Tag 4,999,992.70 Cauayan City, Isabela Mar-Deb Construction and Development National Higway, Cabatuan, 4,993,643.57 3/15/2018

Diversion Road - EDF

Isabela




Approved Budget for

No. Name of Project S Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Bid Amount Bidding Date
17 |Construction of Powerhouse for Maconacon Multi-Purpose 455,682.64 Maconacon, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/19/2018
Evacuation Center -LDRRMF
1 | Construction of Powerhouse for Multi-Purpose Evacuation 399,999.13 llagan City, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/19/2018
Center Capitol Compound - LDRRMF
19 Constru_ctlon of Powerhouse for Palanan Multi-Purpose 468,933.67 Palanan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/19/2018
Evacuation Center - LDRRMF
20 |Rehabilitation of Bautista Brgy. Road - EDF 1,112,946.25 Bautista, San Agustin, Isabela [Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/19/2018
Concreting of Road Leading to Don Mariano Marcos Mr. Manuel P. Soriano
21 |Memorial High School (0.15mx5.00mx170.00m) Brgy. Ipil - 999,962.80 Echague, Isabela Masor Construction National Highway, San Pablo, 999,332.80 3/19/2018
EDF Isabela
o Brgy. Calaocan, San Agustin, R o . X
22 |Rehabilitation of Brgy. Water Supply System - EDF 267,121.75 lsabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/19/2018
. ] . Mr. Manuel P. Soriano
23 |Construction of Steel Truss & Roofings of Sinnabaran 999,069.30 Echague, Isabela Masor Construction National Highway, San Pablo, 998,157.15 3/19/2018
Community Center - EDF
Isabela
24 |Construction of Reinforced Concrete Pathway (Motorcycles 306,565.73 Laoag, San Agustin, Isabela | Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/19/2018
& Pedestrians) - EDF
Construction of Provincial Social & Development & Public . ) . - . .
25 14,436,048.56 Alibagu, llagan City, Isabela |Failed Bidding (No bid submitted N/A N/A 3/19/2018
Safety Office Bldg. Capitol Compound - Capital Outlay 8 € v g ) / / /19/
. . - . . Arch. Armando S. Tan
26 | Concreting of Raniag-Catabban Provincial Road - EDF 10,000,077.18 Burgos, Isabela Golden Tech Construction Corporation A 9,955,087.50 3/19/2018
Raniag, Ramon, Isabela
27 [Repair of H.E Bldg. at Panang Elementary School - SEF 732,564.14 San Agustin, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018
28 Continuation of the Construction of Mini Gymnansium at 407,338.27 Cauayan City, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018
Tagaran Elementary School - SEF
29 |Repair & Rehabilitation of Damaged School Bldg. (Bagong 474,584.79 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018
Lipunan Bldg.) - SEF
30 |Repair &Plastering of Concrete Fence & Gate, Divisoria 365,206.67 Tumauini, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018
Elementary School - SEF
37 |Repair & Rehabilitation of Damaged School Bldg. (Gov. 130,705.76 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018
Benjamin Dy Bldg.) - SEF
i i i i Culalabat, C: City,
32 Contlnuatlorﬁ of the Cpnstru?tlon of Gymnasium at West 1,147,230.00 ulalabat, Cauayan City, Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018
Tabacal Regional National High School - SEF Isabela
33 gledpa')' &szhab"'tat'on of Damaged School Bldg. (FVR 180,053.93 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018
g.) -
34 |Construction of Powerhouse for Dinapigue Multi-Purpose 413,083.79 Dinapigue, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018
Evacuation Center - LDRRMF
35 Construction of Powerhouse for Divilacan Multi-Purpose 1462,385.58 Divilacan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/20/2018

Evacuation Center - LDRRMF




Approved Budget for

No. Name of Project S Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Bid Amount Bidding Date
36 gz:;'_e;;‘f of Benito Soliven-Villaluz-Magsaysay Provincial 10,000,087.51 Benito Soliven, Isabela | Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/21/2018
37 Concreting of Luna-Sta Lucia-San Mateo Provincial Road - 5,000,000.48 Quirino, Isabela Golden Tech Construction Corporation Arct_\. Armando S. Tan 4,963,060.00 3/21/2018
EDF Raniag, Ramon, Isabela
38 |[Construction of Covered Court Rizal - EDF 1,000,168.80 San Guillermo, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/21/2018
39 |Rehabilitation of Ballesteros-Bagong Tanza Provincial Road | - 506 505,18 Aurora, Isabela Golden Tech Construction Corporation Arch. Armando S. Tan 9,960,427.74 3/21/2018
EDF Raniag, Ramon, Isabela
40 E‘;’t‘f:;:f:‘l’g“h°sfi‘g:|“@::s";/ZE)"aE‘;"°” Center of Mallig 999,995.97 Brgy. Olango, Mallig, Isabela |Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/21/2018
a1 ﬁ)"_"éggm"“ of Scommunity Center Brgy. San Jose, (Phase 1,999,463.90 Roxas, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/21/2018
42 gssa" of H.E Bldg. at Cabagan Science Elementary, School - 170,403.26 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
43 EEZiicre&Elif:::i::i‘;‘:ﬂ(fgﬁc;FRBA'Type Bldg. at Cabagan 447,431.57 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
44 g’::';;::::;’;sﬂsﬁ School Bldg. at Cabagan Science 130,404.98 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
a5 2::;; f’;:FCL' BLSB Type Il at Mabangug Elementary 269,802.10 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
46 Ece:;; f’fSéFCL Marcos-Type Bldg. at Mabangug Elementary 257,541.60 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
47 2;’1’;')" f’fS:FCL Cory Aquino-Type Bldg. at Masipi Elementary 184,336.81 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
48 Essa” of 2 CL, BLSB Type Il at Masipi Elementary School - 94,313.94 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
49 |Repair of 2 CL, BGD Type at Masipi Elementary School - SEF 57,813.17 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
50 2;’3” of 2 CL, Grade | Bidg. at Masipi Elementary School - 68,211.38 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
51 |Repair of 2 CL at Garita Primary School - SEF 316,219.33 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
52 |Repair of 1 CL Pagcor at Magassi Elementary School - SEF 51,056.18 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
53 2::2('; f’fS;FCL Kindergarten Bldg. at Magassi Elementary 59,915.98 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018
54 |Repairof 3 CL Marcos-Type Bldg. at Magassi Elementary 349,105.85 Cabagan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/26/2018

School - SEF




. A d Budget fi q .. . . N AR
No. Name of Project ppm‘(’;ntr:ctge or Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Bid Amount Bidding Date
55 [Construction of Ceiling of Paraiso Elementary School - SEF 65,001.60 Cabatuan, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
56 |Provision & Installation of Roofing of Nungnungan 260,030.09 Cauayan City, Isabela  |Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
Elementary School - SEF
57 |Construction of Multi-Purpose Mini -Gymnasium at Pinoma 380,037.40 Cauayan City, Isabela  |Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
National High School - SEF
g |Completion of Roofing Multi-Purpose Bldg. at ISU San 1,599,979.34 San Mateo, Isabela  |Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
Mateo Campus -SEF
59 |Construction of Communal Comfort Room at Buduan 79,966.38 Cauayan City, Isabela | Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
Elementary School - SEF
60 s:sa'r of H.E Bldg. atSinacangan Norte Elementary School - 99,990.96 San Agustin, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
g1 |Repair of BLSB-Type School Bldg. at Sinaoangan Norte 80,049.70 San Agustin, Isabela | Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
Elementary School - SEF
g2 |Renovation of Typhoon Damaged BLSB Type Bidg. at 129,991.13 San Agustin, Isabela  |Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
Calaocan Primary School - SEF
Dorganda E/S, San Agustin, X L . X
63 |Completion of 2 CL Elementary School Bldg. - SEF 181,939.82 g Isébela € Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
64 R'enovatlon & Repair of School Ampi-Theater at San Isidro 660,040.16 San Isidro, Isabela Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 3/27/2018
High School - SEF
TOTAL 112,730,894.77

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

(SGD.) MR. RODRIGO T. SAWIT
BAC Chairman

(SGD.) MS. ELSA M. PASTRANA
BAC Member

(SGD.) ATTY. FRANCIS JAMES E. MEER
BAC Vice Chairman

(SGD.) MS. CHERRY BAGAY-GREGORIO
BAC Member

ATTY. NOEL MANUEL R. LOPEZ
BAC Member

(SGD.) DR. ANGELO C. NAUI
BAC Member

(SGD.) ENGR. VIRGILIO S. LORENZO

BAC Member




