FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Republic of the Philippines
CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT
PROVINCE OF ISABELA

3 Forms to Use:
1. Bid Results on Civil Works

2. Bid Results on Goods and Services

3. Bid Results on Consulting Services
INDIVIDUAL BID-OUTS ARE NOT ALLOWED

1st Quarter, CY 2016
Approved Budget for . L . . Biddin Contract
No. | Reference Name of Project i 8 Location Winning Bidder Name and Address Bid Amount & .
No. Contract Date Duration
Construction of Laboratory Office SIFFU ROCKS 429 National High
1 for Artificial Insemination, Echague, |  Php936,747.58 Echague, Isabela : ational Highway 932,000.00 1/4/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Isabela.
Constructi f Artificial
onstruction— — ot ruticia SIFFU ROCKS #29 National Highway
2 Insemination Building, Echague 682,207.15 Echague, Isabela ] Php678,080.80 1/4/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Isabela.
Improvement of Guiban . SIFFU ROCKS #29 National Highwa
3 P . 8 999,630.00 Guibang, Gamu, Isabela ; & y Php995,067.00 1/4/2016
Community Center. Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
EDFROBON
. . . . . 0 O #518 Narra Street, Cembo,
4 Construction of Dibulos Diversion 737,958.00 Divilacan, Isabela Construction o Php724,109.30 2/19/2016
- . Makati City
Dam, Divilacan, Isabela. Services, Inc.
EDFROBON
. T . . 0 O #518 Narra Street, Cembo,
5 Construction of Minuli Diversion 2,838,074.00 Divilacan, Isabela Construction o Php2,806,484.63 | 2/19/2016
.. . Makati City
Dam, Divilacan, Isabela. Services, Inc.
. . . . . Calamagui 2nd, City of
6 Construction of Cantayan Diversion 4,805,159.00 City of llagan, Isabela 4A's Construction Php4,790,448.87 | 2/19/2016
. llagan, Isabela
Dam, City of llagan, Isabela.
i f | Di i R NED B llon P R
7 Construction of Sangay | Diversion| .0 357 00 Maconacon, Isabela OJUNEL ugation Froper, Ramon. | 12 248,166.50 | 2/19/2016
Dam, Maconacon, Isabela. Construction Isabela
Construction of Dirayrayan
ROJUNED Bugallon Proper, Ramon,
8 Diversion Dam, Maconacon, 4,267,988.00 Maconacon, Isabela . g P Php4,256,991.00 | 2/19/2016
Construction Isabela
Isabela.
9 Construction of Fema Diversion 4,786,904.00 Maconacon, Isabela ROJUNEP Bugallon Proper, Ramon, Phpd,777,746.30 | 2/19/2016
Dam, Maconacon, Isabela. Construction Isabela
CR DOMINGO
. D Di . . 142 . .
10 Construction of Decalao Diversion 11,864,.802.00 Palanan, Isabela Construction and #142 National Highway Php11,850,122.10 | 2/19/2016

Dam, Palanan, Isabela.

Power Development,
Inc.

San Mateo, Isabela




Construction of Sabang Diversion ROJUNED Bugallon Proper, Ramon,
11 4,825,370.00 Palanan, Isabela . Php4,815,938.00 | 2/19/2016
Dam, Palanan, Isabela. Construction Isabela
ALANGDEO
GENERAL
Construction  Calamagui  West . Construction/Upland| Purok 7, Bulanao, Tabuk
12 27,061,531.00 Sta. Maria, Isabela . . . Php27,051,398.20 | 2/19/2016
(SWIP) Sta. Maria, Isabela. Construction and City, Kalinga P 119/
Engineering Services,
Inc. JV
Construction Manano |l (SWIP) . SIFFU ROCKS #29 National Highway
13 ] 8,819,067.00 Mallig, Isabela ; Php8,808,965.25 | 2/19/2016
Mallig, Isabela. Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Construction Santos (SWIP) Danysons Dr. Basilio Reyes Street,
14 28,905,105.00 Quezon, Isabela . i ) Php28,900,372.60 | 2/19/2016
Quezon, Isabela. Construction Distruct 1, Cauayan City
15 Construction 9f Binatug Diversion 1,451,972.00 San Mariano, Isabela ROJUNEP Bugallon Proper, Ramon, Php1,449,559.00 | 2/19/2016
Dam, San Mariano, Isabela. Construction Isabela
i B WIP ACUTAN T il Mi |
16 Construction Bantay (S ) Jones, 5,458,115.00 Jones, Isabela GACU ! anguile Strefet, inante |, Phps5,450,113.51 2/19/2016
Isabela. Construction Cauayan City, Isabela
17 Construction of Nakar Creek, Jones 2580,127.00 Jones, Isabela GACUTA.N Tanguile Strefet, Minante I, Php2,587,111.54 | 2/19/2016
, Isabela Construction Cauayan City, Isabela
. Di ion D . .
18 Construction of JRS Diversion Dam, 2513,031.00 Jones, Isabela GACUTA.N Tanguile Strefet, Minante |, Php2,512,000.00 2/19/2016
Jones, Isabela. Construction Cauayan City, Isabela
19 Consjtructlon Pinatubo 1l (SWIP) 13,256,780.00 Mallig, Isabela SIFFU ROC.KS #29 National Highway Php13,246,315.75 | 2/19/2016
Mallig, Isabela. Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Megabuck
Repair, Rehabilitation and cga uc.s
. . Construction and
20 Extension of PGSO Storage and 2,527,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela Php2,498,628.16 3/4/2016
S Development
Garage Building. .
Corporation
Construction of 2 CL Building at Buildtek
21 Aromin Elementary School, 1,114,200.00 Echague, Isabela uriatex Naguilian. Isabela Php1,109,023.17 | 3/4/2016
Construction
Echague, Isabela.
Construction of 2 CL Building at SIFEU ROCKS 429 National High
22 Dipangit Primary School, Echague, 1,114,200.00 Echague, Isabela . ational Highway Php1,113,157.97 3/4/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Isabela.
Construction of 2 CL Building at SIEFU ROCKS 429 National High
23 Pagrang-Ayan Elementary School, 1,114,200.00 Ramon, Isabela - ational Highway Php1,109,080.98 3/4/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Ramon, Isabela.
Construction of 1 CL Building at
24 Anonang Elementary School, 628,400.00 Cordon, Isabela SMT Construction City of llagan, Isabela Php619,509.89 3/4/2016

Cordon, Isabela.




Construction of 2 CL Building at

25 Wigan Integrated School, Cordon, 1,144,400.00 Cordon, Isabela SMT Construction City of llagan, Isabela Php1,109,716.02 3/4/2016
Isabela.
Construction of 1 CL Building at
SIFFU ROCKS #29 National High
26 Matusalem National High School, 600,300.00 Roxas, Isabela ; ational Highway Php592,535.37 3/4/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Roxas, Isabela.
Continuation of 4 CL, 2 Storey
Building (LOWER LEVEL) Gucab SIFFU ROCKS #29 National Highway
1,889,600.00 Echague, Isabela - Php1,873,045.15 3/4/2016
27 Elementary School, Echague, & Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela P /4
Isabela.
Construction of 3 CL Building at A E. Manuel
28 Rogus Elementary School, Cauayan 1,608,100.00 Cauayan City, Isabela o . San Mateo, Isabela Php1,605,625.10 3/4/2016
. Construction
City, Isabela.
Construction of 3 CL Building at A E. Manuel
29 Marabulig | Elementary School, 1,608,100.00 Cauayan City, Isabela o u San Mateo, Isabela Php1,605,625.10 3/4/2016
. Construction
Cauayan City, Isabela.
Construction of 3 CL Building at Sto. . .
. SIFFU ROCKS #29 National Highway
30 Domingo Elementray School, 1,608,100.00 Echague, Isabela I Php1,604,377.51 3/4/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Echague, Isabela.
Construction of 2 CL Building at Armson
31 Annafunan Elementray School, 1,114,200.00 Echague, Isabela Construction and Cauayan City, Isabela Php1,111,237.43 3/4/2016
Echague, Isabela. Enterprises
Construction of 2 CL Building at
. . SIFFU ROCKS #29 National High
32 Salvacion Primary School, Echague, 1,114,200.00 Echague, Isabela - ational Highway Php1,109,113.65 3/4/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Isabela.
Construction of 3 CL Building at San Buildtek
. i
33 Guillermo Central School, San 1,608,100.00 San Guillermo, Isabela ! . Naguilian. Isabela Php1,605,099.54 3/4/2016
. Construction
Guillermo, Isabela
Construction of Home Economics . SIFFU ROCKS #29 National High
34 ns" _ 1,417,700.00 Alicia, Isabela : ational HIghway | oy, 11 399,555.61 | 3/4/2016
Building of Del Pilar Elementary Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
School, Alicia, Isabela.
Construction of 3 CL Building at San A E. Manuel
35 Antonio Elementary School, 1,608,100.00 Cauayan City, Isabela o . San Mateo, Isabela Php1,605,625.10 | 3/4/2016
. Construction
Cauayan City, Isabela.
Construction of 3 CL Building at
36 Pisang Elementary School, San 1,608,100.00 San Manuel, Isabela Masor Construction San Pablo, Isabela Php1,605,191.30 3/4/2016
Manuel, Isabela.
No bid was received
37 Construction of 1 CL Building at 145,900.00 San Mariano, Isabela until the deadline for - - 3/4/2016

Mallabo Elementary School, San
Mariano, Isabela.

submission and
opening of bids.




Fabrication and Installation of Steel

No bid was received
until the deadline for

38 Trusses and Roofing Materials of 193,500.00 Burgos, Isabela L - - 3/4/2016
. submission and
Raniag Elementary School, Burgos, . .
opening of bids.
Isabela
Construction of 3 CL Building at
39 Tumauini North Central School, 1,608,100.00 Tumauini, Isabela Fragerr Construction San Pablo, Isabela Php1,598,968.81 3/4/2016
Tumauini, Isabela
Continuation the Repair of 6 CL No,bld was re(.:elved
. . . . until the deadline for
40 Building of San Agustin National 490,700.00 San Agustin, Isabela bmission and - - 3/4/2016
(ABAYA BLDG. 2) High School, San su ,'ss'of b?d
Agustin, Isabela Opening or bids.
41 Conftructlon of Public Market - Sta. 3,575,600.00 Sta. Maria, Isabela SIFFU RO;KS #29 National Highway Php3,566,759.43 | 2/29/2016
Maria, Isabela Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
42 Rehablllt.atlon of Local Acess Road - 1303,813.35 Sta. Maria, Isabela SIFFU ROC.KS #29 National Highway Php1,293,010.50 | 2/29/2016
Sta. Maria, Isabela . Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Rehabilitation/Improvement of SIEEU ROCKS #29 Nati | High
ional Highw
43 Echague-Fugu Road, Echague, 15,087,000.00 Echague, Isabela : ational Highway | oy 115,067,983.90 | 3/15/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Isabela.
Limestone
i i i C Street, Cent
44 Construction of Oxygen/Nltrogen 7.000,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela Construction and amacam r'ee ) .en ro Php6,998,388.36 | 3/15/2016
Gas Plant, Ilagan City, Isabela Development East, Santiago City
Corporation
Provision of Water Supply System Cal i 2nd, City of
45 Isto upply 5y 2,000,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela 4A's Construction alamagul and, LY OF | - oy 11,992,439.43 | 3/15/2016
of Multi-Purpose Evacuation llagan, Isabela
Center, llagan City, Isabela
Rehabilitation/Improvement of Maharlika Highway. City of
46 Villaluz-Andarayan Road, Delfin 10,846,000.00 Delfin Albano, Isabela EGB Constrution & i Php10,782,320.94 | 3/15/2016
llagan, Isabela
Albano, Isabela.
Rehabilitation/Improvement of SIFFU ROCKS #29 National Highway
47 . . . 20,378,000.00 Burgos, Isabela ] Php20,353,662.79 | 3/15/2016
Junction National-Dalig-Catabban & Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela P /15/
Road, Burgos, Isabela.
RehablIltatlon/limprovement of Cauayan City and San MAR—I?EB National Highway
48 Villa Concepcion-Rogus-San 53,010,000.00 . Construction and Php52,991,513.49 | 3/15/2016
) Guillermo, Isabela Cabatuan, Isabela
Guillermo, Isabela. Development
I CR DOMINGO
Rehabilitation/Improvement of Construction and #142 National Highwa
49 Alicia-San Isidro Road, Alicia 34,438,000.00 Alicia, Isabela EMWaY | php34,412,001.87 | 3/15/2016

Isabela.

Power Development,
Inc.

San Mateo, Isabela




Improvement of Cabannungan-

National Highway, City of

50 10,000,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela EGB Constrution Php9,555,104.00 | 3/15/2016
Gamu Road, City of llagan, Isabela. ¥ € llagan, Isabela P /15/
Construction of 2 CL Building at ROJUNED Bugallon P R
51 Linamanan Elementary School, 1,167,000.00 Jones, Isabela . ugaflon Froper, Ramon, Php1,163,487.20 | 3/16/2016
Construction Isabela
Jones, Isabela.
Construction of 3 CL Building at
i R NED B llon P R
52 Dabubu High School Annex, 1,652,000.00 San Agustin, Isabela OJUNEL ugalion FToper, Ramon, | - o\ 1 648,374.11 | 3/16/2016
Sinaoangan Sur, San Agustin, Construction Isabela
Isabela.
Provision of Roofing of School No,bld was rec'elved
[ until the deadline for
53 Building at Neuva Era. Elementary 217,000.00 Cabatuan, Isabela o - - 3/16/2016
submission and
School, Cabatuan, Isabela. . )
opening of bids.
No bid ived
Construction of 1 CL attached un?cil 'Icht\alvj;rjlcii:ev?or
54 School Building at San Jose Primary 466,000.00 Jones, Isabela o - - 3/16/2016
submission and
School, Jones, Isabela. . .
opening of bids.
Construction of Computer Room of ROJUNED . R
55 Panang Elementary School, San 658,000.00 San Agustin, Isabela : ugalion FToper, Ramon, | 5y 1654.933.07 | 3/16/2016
. Construction Isabela
Agustin, Isabela.
Repair of Ceiling 4 CL and No bid was received
56 Rt.apalntlng of 10 CL Doragand:':\ 400,000.00 San Agustin, Isabela until the.de.adllne for i ) 3/16/2016
High School, Laoag, San Agustin submission and
Isabela. opening of bids.
Construction of 2 CL Building at SIFFU ROCKS 429 National High
57 Barcolan Elementary School, Gamu, 1,167,000.00 Gamu, Isabela - ational Highway Php1,163,487.20 | 3/16/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Isabela.
Construction of 1 CL Building at
58 Antagan 2nd Elementary School, 658,000.00 Tumauini, Isabela Foref Construction City of llagan, Isabela Php649,971.86 3/16/2016
Tumauini, Isabela.
Construction of 2 CL Building at Buildtek
59 Salindingan Elementary School, 1,167,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela u! e. Naguilian. Isabela Php1,110,999.71 | 3/16/2016
- Construction
Ilagan City, Isabela.
Repair of H.E. Building at Lingaling Mar-DEB . .
. . . National Highway
60 Elementary School, Sta. Maria, 962,450.00 Sta. Maria, Isabela Construction and Php917,278.55 3/16/2016
Cabatuan, Isabela
Isabela. Development
Rehabilitation of 3 CL BLSB type
School Building at Carmencita . . .
61 951,000.00 Delfin Albano, Isabela Foref Construction City of llagan, Isabela Php943,547.43 3/16/2016

Elementary School, Delfin Albano,
Isabela.




Construction of 1 CL School Building

. SIFFU ROCKS #29 National Highway
62 at Raniag Elementary School, 658,000.00 Burgos, Isabela - Php655,715.34 3/16/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Burgos, Isabela.
Constructi f 2 CL Buildi t IFFU ROCK #29 Nati | High
63 onstruction o ullding a 1,167,000.00 Gamu, Isabela SIFFUROCKS o National Highway oy ) 163,487.20 | 3/16/2016
Furao Elementary School. Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Construction of 1 Unit H.E. Building SIFFU ROCKS 429 Nati | Hieh
64 at Mabini Elementary School, 1,485,000.00 Gamu, Isabela : atonatmilghway | oy 1 483,348.26 | 3/16/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Gamu, Isabela.
Construction of 1 CL School Building SIFEU ROCKS 429 National High
65 at Aurora Elementary School, 658,000.00 Quezon, Isabela ; ational Highway Php655,715.34 3/16/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Quezon, Isabela.
No bid was received
66 Repair of 2 CL Building at Malasin 350,000.00 Burgos, Isabela until the.de.adllne for i ) 3/16/2016
Elementary School, Burgos, Isabela. submission and
opening of bids.
No bid was received
Repair of 1 CL Building at Masigun until the deadline for
67 100,000.00 Burgos, Isabela o - - 3/16/2016
Elementary School, Burgos, Isabela. submission and
opening of bids.
No bid ived
Repair/Improvement of 1 CL School O, 1awas rec;ewe
. . until the deadline for
68 Building at Dalig Elementary 105,997.00 Burgos, Isabela o - - 3/16/2016
submission and
School, Burgos, Isabela. . .
opening of bids.
Mar-DEB National Highwa
69 Construction of 3 CL Building at 1,684,000.00 Cauayan City, Isabela Construction and ghway Php1,677,144.51 | 3/16/2016
Cabatuan, Isabela
Cauayan North Central School Development
Construction of 1 CL School Building SIFEU ROCKS 429 National High
70 at Estrella Elementary School, San 658,000.00 San Mateo, Isabela : ational Highway Php655,715.34 | 3/16/2016
Construction Bantug, Roxas, Isabela
Mateo, Isabela.
No bid was received
71 Repair olema.plgue National High 400,000.00 Dinapigue, Isabela until the.de?adllne for - - 3/16/2016
School, Dinapigue, Isabela. submission and
opening of bids.
Construction of 2 CL School Building Mar-DEB . .
. . . . National Highway
72 at Regional Training School, 1,167,000.00 Cauayan City, Isabela Construction and Php1,161,654.44 | 3/16/2016

Minante 1, Cauayan City, Isabela.

Development

Cabatuan, Isabela




. . No bid was received
Construction of Drainage System at . .
until the deadline for
73 San Manuel Central School, San 100,000.00 San Manuel, Isabela L - - 3/16/2016
submission and
Manuel, Isabela. . .
opening of bids.
Limestone
Constructi f Stage for Isabel i C Street, Cent
74 onstruction of Stage for Isabela 2,806,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela | COmstruction and amacam Street, ~entro 1 pnn2,905,783.38 | 3/21/2016
Sports Complex. Development East, Santiago City
Corporation
Construction of Camarag-Patanad Golden Tech
75 . J 3,059,000.00 San Isidro, Isabela Construction Raniag, Ramon, Isabela Php3,051,117.00 3/22/2016
Road, San Isidro, Isabela .
Corporation
No bid was received
Upgrading of Existing Level lll . until the deadline for
76 4,600,000.00 Sta. Maria, Isabela . - - 3/22/2016
Water System, Sta. Maria, Isabela. submission and 122/
opening of bids.
No bid ived
Rehabilitation/Gravelling of unc')cil ;h:lj:;jﬁsgfor
77 Municipal Road with Box Culvert 1,832,000.00 Palanan, Isabela L - - 3/22/2016
submission and
and RCPC, Palanan, Isabela. . .
opening of bids.
NG bi .
Construction of 2 Units Greenhouse un:ﬂigj:;jﬁ:gfjr
78 with Drip Irrigation System, 1,387,500.00 San Pablo, Isabela L - - 3/22/2016
submission and
Ballacayu, San Pablo, Isabela. . .
opening of bids.
No bid was received
e s B . . .
79 Réhab'“tat'on of P'NP arracks, 1,250,000.00 Cauayan City, Isabela until the'detadllne for - - 3/22/2016
Alinam Cauayan City, Isabela. submission and
opening of bids.
Construction of BFP and PDRRMO Calamagui 2nd. City of
80 Building, Capitol, llagan City, 9,559,000.00 City of llagan, Isabela 4A's Construction 8 i Php9,549,128.22 3/22/2016
lsabela llagan, Isabela

(SGD.) MR. RODRIGO T. SAWIT

BAC Chairman

(SGD.) MS. ELSA M. PASTRANA

BAC Member

(SGD.) Atty. FRANCIS JAMES E. MEER

Atty. NOEL MANUEL R. LOPEZ

BAC Vice Chairman

(SGD.) MS. CHERRY BAGAY-GREGORIO

BAC Member

BAC Member

(SGD.) Dr. ANGELO C. NAUI, DVM
BAC Member

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

(SGD.) Engr. VIRGILIO S. LORENZO

BAC Member

















































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































Repair/Improvement of 1 CL School
Building at Dalig Elementary
School, Burgos, Isabela.




